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Jonathan Weiss (SBN 143895) 
LAW OFFICE OF JONATHAN WEISS 
10576 Troon Avenue 
Los Angeles, California  90064-4436 
Telephone:  (310) 558-0404 
Email:  jw@lojw.com  
 
Attorneys for Plaintiff and the Proposed Class 
[Additional Attorneys listed on Signature Page] 
       

SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE OF CALIFORNIA 

FOR THE COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES                              
JAMES E. ELIAS, etc., et al.,  
 
 Plaintiffs, 
 
 v. 
 
SYNCHRONY BANK, etc., et al., 
 
 Defendants. 

Case No.:  BC 555883 
 
CLASS ACTION 
 
PLAINTIFFS’ NOTICE OF MOTION 
AND MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF 
ATTORNEYS’ FEES, CLASS 
REPRESENTATIVES’ ENHANCEMENT 
AWARDS, ADMINISTRATION COSTS, 
AND LITIGATION COSTS; 
MEMORANDUM OF POINTS AND 
AUTHORITIES; AND SUPPORTING 
DECLARATIONS 
 
[Hon. Kenneth R. Freeman – Dept. 310] 
 
Date: December 7, 2017 
Time: 10:00 a.m. 
Dept.: 310 
 
Date filed: March 13, 2017  
Trial date: Not set    

TO ALL PARTIES AND TO THEIR ATTORNEYS OF RECORD HEREIN: 

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that on December 7, 2017 at 10 a.m., or as soon 

thereafter as counsel may be heard before the Honorable Kenneth R. Freeman in 
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Department 310 of the above-entitled Court located at 600 South Commonwealth 

Avenue, Los Angeles, California 90005, Plaintiff will move the Court for $399,999 in 

attorneys’ fees, enhancement awards of $10,000 to Plaintiff James Elias and $5,000 to 

Plaintiff James Kozik, allocation of up to $116,306.34 in administrator fees, and 

reimbursement of $22,310.99 in costs, all from the common fund.   

This Motion is based on the parties’ agreement and on equity inasmuch as 

Plaintiffs, through their counsel, enforced important public rights by obtaining $999,999 

on behalf of 135,000 consumers.  It is based on Plaintiffs’ Notice of Motion and 

Motion, their Memorandum of Points and Authorities, the Declarations of Plaintiffs and 

their counsel, the Court’s file herein, and on such other matters as the Court may take 

notice. 

 

 

Dated:  September 29, 2017   LAW OFFICE OF JONATHAN WEISS 
 

       /s/        
       Jonathan Weiss 

Attorney for Plaintiff 
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MEMORANDUM OF POINTS AND AUTHORITIES 

1. Introduction 

In this case, Plaintiffs allege that Synchrony recorded their telephone conversations 

without proper disclosure and without consent, in violation of the California Invasion of 

Privacy Act (CIPA).  “California was the first state to deal with the problem of electronic 

surveillance when, in 1862, it outlawed the tapping of telegraph lines.”1  Just over 100 years 

later (in 1967), the Legislature enacted CIPA “to protect the right of privacy of the people of 

this state.”  (Pen. Code, § 630.)  CIPA now bars recording telephone calls without the caller 

and recipient’s prior consent.  (Pen. Code, §§ 632, 632.7.)2     

Recording is not disputed in this case.  What is disputed is whether beep tones 

playing during a call give the advance notice required to get consent to recording.  When 

tariffs were in place, and before the computer age, when very few things in life “beeped,” 

the answer was clearly yes.  Since detariffing, beep tone “notice” has been an open question.   

After two and a half years of litigation and one and a half days of mediation, retired 

Supreme Court Justice Edward Panelli brokered a settlement whereby Synchrony Bank 

would create a non-reversionary settlement fund of nearly $1 million dollars.  Plaintiffs 

believe that the settlement achieves CIPA’s punishment and deterrence goals.3 
                                                 
 

1 Comment, Electronic Surveillance in California:  A Study in State Legislative 
Control (1969) 57 Cal.L.Rev. 1182, 1189 (Electronic Surveillance in California). 

2 With the Privacy Act, 
the California Legislature enacted a broad, protective invasion-of-privacy 
statute in response to what it viewed as a serious and increasing threat to the 
confidentiality of private communications resulting from then recent advances 
in science and technology that had led to the development of new devices and 
techniques for eavesdropping upon and recording such private 
communications. 

(Kearney v. Salomon Smith Barney, Inc. (2006) 39 Cal.4th 95.) 
3 CIPA also provides a remedy for those actually damaged by illegal recording.  

Injured persons may seek “Three times the amount of actual damages, if any ….”  (Pen. 
Code, § 637.2, subd. (c)(2).)  Class members seeking actual damages can opt out. 
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The settlement was preliminarily approved on June 16, 2017.  Consistent with the 

preliminary approval order, Plaintiffs seek fees, costs, administrator’s fees, and 

enhancements.4 

 

2. Attorneys’ Fees 

“California has long recognized, as an exception to the general American rule that 

parties bear the costs of their own attorneys, the propriety of awarding an attorney fee to a 

party who has recovered or preserved a monetary fund for the benefit of himself or herself 

and others.  (Laffitte v. Robert Half Internat., Inc. (2016) 1 Cal.5th 480.)  In this case, the 

parties agreed that Plaintiffs would seek attorneys’ fees from a common fund of just under a 

million dollars.  (June 12, 2017, Amended Settlement Agreement, § 3.6(a) [“As part of the 

settlement, Class Counsel shall apply to the Court for an award of attorneys’ fees and costs 

from the Common Fund.  Defendant may oppose the application.”].)   

Plaintiffs’ attorneys collectively expended over 1100 hours on this case, not 

including time on this motion, on the fairness hearing, and on monitoring class 

administration.  (See § 2.B below.)  Surveys show that comparable attorneys charge 

between $500 and $645 per hour.  (See § 2.C(5) below.)  Based on the lodestar factors, 

Plaintiffs submit that reasonable hourly rates for their counsel are $600 for Weiss, Borison, 

and Holland and $400 for Berke.  Plaintiffs ask this Court to set attorneys’ fees at $399,999, 

which is only 60% of the lodestar of $662,090, and which does not include a multiplier.5   
                                                 
 

4 Briefing was required by September 29, 2017.  Class members’ claims, opt-outs, 
objections, and notices of intention to appear are due by October 24, 2017.  The final 
approval motion must be filed by November 7, 2017, with responses to any objections filed 
by November 13, 2017. 

5 Weiss, Borison, and Holland collectively spent 1085.9 hours; multiplied by their 
reasonable hourly rate of $600, that lodestar is $651,510.  Berke’s 26.5 hours times his $400 
hourly rate totals $10,580, for a total lodestar of $662,090.  The agreement on allocation of 
attorneys’ fees was detailed in Plaintiffs’ May 2, 2017, Further Briefing re Motion for 
Preliminary Approval:  fees will be divided equally among counsel. 
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A. Lodestar calculation in general 

“In so-called fee shifting cases, in which the responsibility to pay attorney fees is 

statutorily or otherwise transferred from the prevailing plaintiff or class to the defendant, the 

primary method for establishing the amount of ‘reasonable’ attorney fees is the lodestar 

method.”  (Lealao v. Beneficial California, Inc. (2000) 82 Cal.App.4th 19, 26 (Lealao).)   

The Court can rely on its experience in setting the lodestar.  “The ‘experienced 

trial judge is the best judge of the value of professional services rendered in his court, 

and while his judgment is of course subject to review, it will not be disturbed unless the 

appellate court is convinced that it is clearly wrong.’  [Citations.]”  (Serrano v. Priest 

(1977) 20 Cal.3d 25, 49.)  “The lodestar (or touchstone) is produced by multiplying the 

number of hours reasonably expended by counsel by a reasonable hourly rate.”  (Lealao, 

supra, 82 Cal.App.4th at p. 26.)  The reasonable market value of an attorney’s services is a 

reasonable hourly rate, regardless of what the attorney actually charged the party.  (Building 

a Better Redondo, Inc. v. City of Redondo Beach (2012) 203 Cal.App.4th 852, 873.)  

When requesting fees in a class action, counsel may submit declarations 

summarizing the work performed, the hours spent, and the hourly rates for the attorneys.  

(Chavez v. Netflix, Inc. (2008) 162 Cal.App.4th 43, 64 [“detailed timesheets are not required 

of class counsel to support fee awards in class action cases” “court may award fees based on 

time estimates for attorneys who do not keep time records”]; Sutter Health Uninsured 

Pricing Cases (2009) 171 Cal.App.4th 495, 512 [“Most of these declarations were 

summaries and … the lead firm … did not submit hourly timesheets.”].)6 

 

                                                 
 

6 In Wershba v. Apple Computer, Inc. (2001) 91 Cal.App.4th 224, 254, the Court of 
Appeal upheld an attorneys fee award despite the facts that “there were no timesheets 
submitted describing work done; there was no evidence establishing the rate charged as a 
reasonable hourly rate; and there was no evidence from which the court could make findings 
regarding the various factors considered in the lodestar approach.”  (Italics added.)  
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B. Counsel reasonably expended over 1100 hours on this case  

Timesheets submitted here show that Attorney Weiss had spent over 920 hours on 

the case as of September 14, 2017; Attorney Borison spent over 116 hours; Holland 47 

hours; and Berke 26 hours.  (Weiss Decl., ¶ 7; Borison Decl., ¶ 7; Holland Decl., ¶ 5; Berke 

Decl., ¶ 8.)  The time spent was reasonably necessary to pursue this case.  (Weiss Decl., ¶ 7; 

see Building a Better Redondo, Inc. v. City of Redondo Beach, supra, 203 Cal.App.4th at p. 

874 [rejecting claim that “counsel logged excessive and duplicative hours on discrete tasks, 

such as claiming over 90 hours for drafting a single petition for writ of mandate and an 

additional 70-plus hours on the motion for the writ of mandate”].)  

Time spent preparing this motion, on further hearings, and overseeing class 

administration are excluded.  Time working on Elias I is not included.  On June 20, 2014, 

when complying with a December 2013 subpoena in Elias I, Synchrony Bank produced a 

previously secret recording of James Elias, revealing the recording practice at issue here.  

Attorneys’ time entries herewith begin on June 21, 2014.7   

 

C. Attorneys’ reasonable hourly rates 

Flannery v. California Highway Patrol (1998) 61 Cal.App.4th 629, 632-633, 

explains the standards for a reasonable hourly rate.  “To establish that reasonable hourly 

rate, [the trial court] considered the skill and experience of the attorneys, the nature of the 

work performed, the relevant area of expertise, their customary billing rates, and the 

                                                 
 

7 On September 30, 2013, Plaintiff Elias brought a case in District Court against debt 
collectors for attempting to collect on a debt generated by an identity thief in Elias’ name.  
(Elias v. Joshua Bronstein, et al., United States District Court for the Central District of 
California, Case No. CV 13-7231 GHK (RZx) (Elias I).)  On February 27, 2014, Elias 
amended his federal suit to enjoin Defendant Synchrony Bank from selling identity theft-
generated debt (such as that for which he had been hounded).  However – because 
likelihood of being injured again is a prerequisite for federal courts exercising Article III 
injunctive powers and Elias was unlikely to be injured again – Defendant Synchrony Bank 
was dismissed from Elias I on June 9, 2014.   
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prevailing rate charged by attorneys of similar skill and experience with comparable legal 

services in the community.”  The relevant “community” for purposes of determining 

reasonable fees is the community where the court is located.  (Altavion, Inc. v. Konica 

Minolta Systems Laboratory, Inc. (2014) 226 Cal.App.4th 26, 71-72.)  

Under Serrano III, the lodestar is the basic fee for comparable legal 

services in the community; it may be adjusted by the court based on factors 

including, as relevant herein, (1) the novelty and difficulty of the questions 

involved, (2) the skill displayed in presenting them, (3) the extent to which the 

nature of the litigation precluded other employment by the attorneys, (4) the 

contingent nature of the fee award.  [Citation.]  The purpose of such 

adjustment is to fix a fee at the fair market value for the particular action.  In 

effect, the court determines, retrospectively, whether the litigation involved a 

contingent risk or required extraordinary legal skill justifying augmentation of 

the unadorned lodestar in order to approximate the fair market rate for such 

services. 

(Ketchum v. Moses (2001) 24 Cal.4th 1122, 1132.)  “[A]s explained in Flannery v. 

California Highway Patrol (1998), at page 61, when a trial court takes the skill and 

experience of the attorneys and the nature of the work performed into account when it 

calculates the reasonable hourly rate, it cannot also use those factors to enhance or apply a 

multiplier to the award.”  (Lealao v. Beneficial California, Inc., supra, at p. 41, fn. 10.)  

Here, the adjustment is made only once, i.e., in proposing the reasonable hourly rate.  (See 

§§ 2.C(1) and (2) below.)   

 

(1) Skill and experience of the attorneys 

Plaintiffs’ counsel have between 25 and 39 years of experience and superior skill in 

litigation.  (Weiss Decl., ¶ 1; Borison Decl., ¶ 3; Holland Decl., ¶ 3; Berke Decl., ¶ 1.)  Class 
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counsel have been appointed in previous consumer protection class actions.8  After filing 

the Preliminary Approval Motion, attorney Holland’s scholarship was quoted in United 

States Supreme Court Justice Elana Kagan’s dissenting opinion in Midland Funding, LLC v. 

Johnson (2017) 137 S.Ct. 1407, 1417.  Even more recently, in approving attorneys’ fees in 

the amount of 40% of the Settlement Fund, United States District Judge Ellen Hollander 

described attorney Borison as an “experienced litigator in the field of consumer litigation” 

who obtained a “prompt and substantial settlement for the Class.”  (Jernigan v. Protas 

(D.Md. Sept. 20, 2017, No. ELH-16-03058) 2017 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 154241, at *9.) 

 Counsel’s skill and experience in advocacy were needed to address novel and 

difficult arguments presented by Defendant’s team of CIPA defense attorneys.  

Plaintiffs’ counsel did their homework and were able to show the full picture, including 

contextualizing Defendant’s reliance on cherry-picked unpublished trial court opinions.9  

Plaintiffs were also able to minimize the filing of discovery motions by engaging in 

detailed meet and confer letters and follow-up discovery.  (Weiss Decl., ¶ 7.)  Plaintiff’s 

counsel ultimately were able to contact class members, obtain an additional class 

representative, and establish the breadth and commonality of the alleged violations.   

 

                                                 
 

8 Plaintiffs did not seek to have attorney Michael N. Berke appointed as class 
counsel, since they already had three experienced class counsel.  However, Mr. Berke was 
engaged in all aspects of litigation up to the point of certification, including appearing 
before this Court and defending Mr. Elias’ deposition.  (Berke Decl., ¶ 7.) 

9 E.g., Kamberian v. Charles Schwab & Co., Inc. (S. F. Super. Ct., Nov. 23, 2015, 
case no. CGC-12-518383) 2015 WL 10733077), a case defended by the same counsel and 
cited by them in this case for the principal that “[b]ecause Defendant complied with the 
tariff by playing beep tones, its conduct is exempted from Sections 632 and 632.7, and 
Defendant cannot be liable to Plaintiffs or the class as a matter of law.”  (Defendant 
Synchrony Bank’s Response to the Court’s April 10, 2017 Order Directing Further Briefing 
in Support of Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement, p. 2, ll. 15-27.) 
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(2) Nature of the work performed 

Plaintiffs’ counsel performed a valuable service by vindicating important privacy 

rights.  In order to accomplish these results, Plaintiffs’ counsel engaged in painstaking and 

meticulous factual discovery and legal analysis and delved into what constitutes 

“disclosure” in the modern detariffing context.  (Weiss Decl., ¶ 6.)   

 

(3) Relevant area of expertise 

This case implicated consumer, collection, regulatory, telecommunications, 

privacy, and class action law – areas in which Plaintiff’s team of attorneys have 

extensively litigated.  (Weiss Decl., ¶ 4; Borison Decl., ¶ 5; Holland Decl., ¶ 4; Berke 

Decl., ¶ 6.)  

 

(4) Customary billing rate 

Mr. Weiss’ customary hourly rate is $250 (Weiss Decl., ¶ 8); Mr. Borison’s is $550.  

(Borison Decl., ¶ 7); Mr. Holland’s is $475 (Holland Decl., ¶ 6); and Mr. Berke’s is $400 

(Berke Decl., ¶ 9).   

 

(5) Prevailing rate charged by attorneys of similar skill and experience 

with comparable legal services in the community 

Courts rely on their own experience, on attorneys’ declarations, and on surveys, such 

as the United States Consumer Law Attorney Fee Survey Report (“Survey”) and the Laffey 

Matrix, to determine the prevailing rate in the community.  (Syers Properties III, Inc. v. 

Rankin (2014) 226 Cal.App.4th 691, 702 [“trial court’s rate determination was supported 

not only by the adjusted Laffey Matrix, but also by Feeney, an attorney with more than 20 

years’ experience in civil litigation of this type”]; Ramirez v. N. Am. Asset Servs., LLC 

(C.D.Cal. Apr. 9, 2012, No. CV 11-10237-GHK) 2012 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 54641, *7 

[argument opposing the Survey was “untethered” to reality in light of the Survey report’s 

resulting data].) 



 

MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES, ENHANCEMENTS, ADMINISTRATION AND LITIGATION COSTS 
 
 

Page 8 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

 

LA
W

 O
FF

IC
E 

JO
NA

TH
AN

 W
EIS

S 
   

10
57

6 
Tr

oo
n 

A
ve

nu
e 

Lo
s A

ng
el

es
, C

al
ifo

rn
ia

  9
00

64
-4

43
6 

 

The Survey shows hourly rates for attorney’s providing comparable legal services in 

Los Angeles.  The median rate for class action attorneys is $500; the median rate for the top 

quartile of consumer lawyers is $600.  (Survey, p. 182.)  Attorneys with these counsel’s 

years of experience charge from $534 to $645.  (Survey, p. 183.)10  Defendant’s senior 

counsel bills at a higher rate:  $825 when this case was filed.11   

 

(6) Novelty and difficulty of the questions involved 

This case is sui generis.  Defendant correctly informed this Court that “no court has 

ever found that a defendant who complied with a tariff by playing periodic beep tones when 

recording calls violated the law.”  (Defendant Synchrony Bank’s Response to the Court’s 

April 10, 2017 Order Directing Further Briefing in Support of Preliminary Approval of 

Class Action Settlement, p. 2, ll. 19-22, fn. omitted.)  Yet Plaintiffs were able to obtain a 

significant settlement. 

 

(7) Extent to which nature of litigation precluded employment  

Counsel gave up other employment to work on this case.  (Weiss Decl., ¶ 7.) 

 

                                                 
 

10 The Laffey Matrix, which aggregates all areas of practice, shows billing rates for 
D.C. attorneys with more than 20 years out of law school at $789-864 during the pendency 
of this case.  (Exhibit H.)  “[T]he Laffey Matrix ‘is an official source of attorney rates based 
in the District of Columbia area, which can be adjusted to the San Francisco Bay Area by 
using the Locality Pay Tables.’  Application of the same formula used by Chief Judge 
Walker in In re HPL Technologies, Inc. Securities Litigation (N.D.Cal. 2005) 366 
F.Supp.2d 912, 922, footnote 1… provided an approximately 9 percent upward rate over 
rates in the District of Columbia.”  (Syers Properties III, Inc. v. Rankin, supra, at pp. 695-
696.) 

11 Perrie M. Weiner, Esq., the senior defense attorney on this case (as shown on all of 
Defendant’s pleadings) “charged $780 per hour in 2013 and $825 per hour in 2014.”  (SEC 
v. Yorkville Advisors, LLC (S.D.N.Y. Feb. 27, 2015, No. 12 Civ. 7728) 2015 U.S. Dist. 
LEXIS 24578, at *26.)  
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(8) Contingent nature of the fee award  

Fee enhancement creates an incentive for attorneys to take the risk inherent in 

contingency cases, such as this one.     

“The economic rationale for fee enhancement in contingency cases has been 

explained as follows:  ‘A contingent fee must be higher than a fee for the same legal 

services paid as they are performed.  The contingent fee compensates the lawyer not 

only for the legal services he renders but for the loan of those services.  The implicit 

interest rate on such a loan is higher because the risk of default (the loss of the case, 

which cancels the debt of the client to the lawyer) is much higher than that of 

conventional loans.”  (Posner, Economic Analysis of Law (4th ed. 1992)  pp. 534, 

567.)  “A lawyer who both bears the risk of not being paid and provides legal 

services is not receiving the fair market value of his work if he is paid only for the 

second of these functions.  If he is paid no more, competent counsel will be reluctant 

to accept fee award cases.”  (Leubsdorf, The Contingency Factor in Attorney Fee 

Awards (1981) 90 Yale L.J. 473, 480; see also Rules Prof. Conduct, rule 4-200(B)(9) 

[recognizing the contingent nature of attorney representation as an appropriate 

component in considering whether a fee is reasonable]; ABA Model Code Prof. 

Responsibility, DR 2-106(B)(8) [same]; ABA Model Rules Prof. Conduct, rule 

1.5(a)(8).)”   

(Ketchum v. Moses, supra, at pp. 1132-1133.) 

 

3. Class Representative Enhancements 

Both Plaintiffs seek enhancements for their time, effort, and sacrifice.  Both gave up 

individual claims and signed broader releases than other class members – waiving Civil 

Code section 1542 when unnamed class members did not.  Plaintiff Elias sacrificed a 

$30,000 statutory offer to him individually. 

Citing Munoz v. BCI Coca-Cola Bottling Co. of Los Angeles (2010) 186 

Cal.App.4th 399, 412, and Radcliffe v. Experian Information Solutions Inc. (9th Cir. 
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2013) 715 F.3d 1157, 1165, the Court previously states that it “will not award more than 

$5,000 for an enhancement absent exceptional circumstances.”  (Preliminary Approval 

Checklist Order dated April 10, 2017, p. 2 [emphasis added].)  Indeed, the 

circumstances in James Elias’ case are exceptional.  Mr. Elias (or Dr. Elias – he’s a 

retired Ph.D. professor who goes by Mr. Elias, Dr. Elias, or even Dr. Jim) wanted to set 

things right for himself and for others.  He was so committed that, despite his age and 

ill-health, he chose to be integrally involved in this litigation, spending nearly 40 hours 

on the case.  (Weiss Decl., ¶ 9; Elias Decl., ¶ 5.)  He was so committed that he declined 

an offer of $30,000 to settle on an individual basis.  (Weiss Decl., ¶ 11.)   

Both class representatives dedicated substantial time to assisting counsel with the 

case, including telephone calls and meetings with class counsel, gathering documents 

and responding to discovery requests, and being deposed.  The proposed enhancements – 

$10,000 for James Elias and $5000 for James Kozik – were disclosed to the class; so far, 

nobody has objected.  (Weiss Decl., ¶ 12; cf. In re Cellphone Termination Fee Cases (2010) 

186 Cal.App.4th 1380, 1393 [approving incentive awards of $10,000 for all four named 

plaintiffs]; Van Vranken v. Atl. Richfield Co. (N.D.Cal. 1995) 901 F.Supp. 294, 300 

[“incentive award of $50,000 is just and reasonable under the circumstances”]; Trujillo v. 

City of Ontario (C.D.Cal. Aug. 24, 2009), 2009 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 79309, at *13 [“(1) the 

$10,000 incentive payments to ten of the persons named in the original Complaint … are 

reasonable; (2) the $30,000 incentive payments to the Class Representatives are 

reasonable.”].) 
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4. Administrator Expense 

As approved by the Court, to ensure at least 70 percent reach,12 the Administrator 

purchased a total purchase of 40,370,000 Internet impressions at $44,927.  Because 

Defendant’s address list fell 799 short of the anticipated 15,000 (at 14,201), additional 

impressions were bought for $1,288.  Claims were also higher than estimated – seven 

percent of the class as of September 21, 2017 (see Exhibit I) versus the estimated three 

percent, increasing the administration cost.  The Administrator’s estimated cost at 

completion is between $106,106.34 and $116,306.34.  (See Exhibit F.) 

 

5. Costs  

Plaintiffs seek reimbursement of expenses of $22,310.99.  (Weiss Decl., ¶ 3(e).) 

 

6. Conclusion 

Plaintiffs obtained a difficult and salutary settlement in a novel CIPA case.  They 

have vindicated the right to actual notice of recording by punishing and deterring the “beep-

tone-only” practice.  (Cf. Flannery v. California Highway Patrol, supra, 61 Cal.App.4th at 

p. 635 [“Because the public always has a significant interest in seeing that laws are 

enforced, it always derives some benefit when illegal private or public conduct is 

rectified.”].)  To encourage continued private enforcement of public laws, the fees, costs, 

and awards sought herein should be approved. 

 

 

                                                 
 

12 Edwards v. Nat’l Milk Producers Fed’n 
(N.D.Cal. June 26, 2017, No. 11-CV-04766-JSW) 2017 U.S.Dist.LEXIS 145217, at *19, fn. 
45 (“Federal Judicial Center, Judge’s Class Action Notice and Claims Process Checklist 
and Plain Language Guide 2010 (‘The lynchpin in an objective determination of the 
adequacy of a proposed notice effort is whether all the notice efforts together will reach a 
high percentage of the class.  It is reasonable to reach between 70-95%.’).”) 
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Dated:  September 29, 2017   LAW OFFICE OF JONATHAN WEISS 
 

       /s/        
       Jonathan Weiss 

Attorney for Plaintiff 
 
Michael N. Berke, SBN 81317 
LAW OFFICE OF MICHAEL N. BERKE 
25001 The Old Road 
Santa Clarita, California  91381-2252 
Telephone:   (661) 259-1800            
/s/        

       Michael N. Berke 
Attorney for Plaintiff 
 
Scott C. Borison, SBN 289456 
LEGG LAW FIRM, LLP 
1900 South Norfolk Street, Suite 350 
San Mateo, California  94403-1171 
Telephone:  (301) 620-1016  
Email:  borison@legglaw.com  
 
/s/        

       Scott C. Borison 
Attorney for Plaintiff 

 
Peter A. Holland, pro hac vice  
THE HOLLAND LAW FIRM, P.C. 
1910 Towne Centre Blvd., Ste. 250 
Post Office Box 6268 
Annapolis, Maryland  21401-0268 
Telephone:  (410) 280-6133  
Email:  peter@hollandlawfirm.com  
 
/s/        

       Peter A. Holland 
Attorney for Plaintiff 

  



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Declaration 
Jonathan Weiss  
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DECLARATION OF JONATHAN WEISS 

 

I, Jonathan Weiss, do hereby declare as follows: 

1. I am an attorney at law duly licensed since 1989 to practice before all courts 

in the State of California and am an attorney of record for Plaintiffs herein. 

2. Unless otherwise indicated, the matters stated herein are personally known to 

me. 

3. EXHIBITS.  The Exhibits hereto are true and correct copies of what they are 

purported to be, as follows: 

a. Exhibit A – my timesheet; 

b. Exhibit B – Scott Borison’s timesheet;   

c. Exhibit C – Peter Holland’s timesheet;   

d. Exhibit D – Michael Berke’s timesheet;   

e. Exhibit E – ledger showing reasonable expenses incurred in this case; 

f. Exhibit F – cost to completion estimate by Administrator KCC; 

g. Exhibit G – relevant excerpts from the United States Consumer Law 

Attorney Fee Survey Report; 

h. Exhibit H – Laffey Matrix, obtained from http://www.laffeymatrix 

.com/ (last visited on Sept. 25, 2017); 

i. Exhibit I – Administrator’s Weekly Case Status Report (Sept. 21, 

2017). 

4. I have represented thousands of workers and millions of consumers in 

dozens of class and representative actions.  I have represented both plaintiffs and a 

defendant in such actions.  Several cases I’ve handled involved (and involve) 

government regulations, including tariffs.  Among those cases are:   

a.  I was co-counsel in Van Aalst v. Mac Tools (Super Ct. Kern County, 

1992, case no. 221425 AEW).  There, I successfully brought The Stanley Works 

(Defendant Mac Tools’ parent corporation) into litigation that, in about 1994, 
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resulted in a multi-million dollar global settlement on behalf of about 100 tool 

dealers, including 30 dealers whom I personally represented.   

b. I was co-counsel for the class in Travathan v. Northbrook (Chancery 

Div. of the Circ. Ct. of Cook County, 2000, case no. 00 CH 01526).  There, the 

Court held that I adequately represented the class as class counsel in a case 

against Snap-on Incorporated and Northbrook Property and Casualty Insurance 

Co.  The Illinois Court, as well as a United States District Court (in Mugar v. 

Northbrook (C.D.Cal. 1997, case no. SACV 97-855-AHS (ANx))) approved the 

class settlement, including attorneys’ fees.  In those cases, I was the only class 

counsel with class action experience. 

c. I was co-counsel for the class in Creed v. Sara Lee (Super. Ct. L.A. 

County, 1998, case no. BC 185718), an individual and representative action that, 

after trial, was certified for settlement.  In 2002, the court approved the class 

settlement providing absent class members with between $500 and $87,402 in 

compensation.   

d. I was sole class counsel in Manibog v. MediaOne of Los Angeles, 

Inc. (Super. Ct. L.A. County, 1998, no. BC 195925) and in Manibog v. MediaOne 

of Los Angeles, Inc. (2000) 81 Cal.App.4th 1366, which derived from that case.  

The former case settled as a class action, and the court approved the settlement 

on behalf of the consumer class in about March 2003. 

e. I was sole class counsel in Utility Consumers’ Action Network, Inc. 

v. Charter Communications, Inc. (Super. Ct. L.A. County, 2000, no. BC 227219).  

The case settled as a class action, and the court approved the settlement on behalf 

of the consumer class in about September 2004. 

f. I was co-counsel for the class in Reynolds v. Earl Scheib, Inc. 

(Super. Ct. L.A. County, 2000, no. BC 226353).  The case settled as a class 

action, and the Court approved the settlement, including attorneys’ fees. 

g. I was co-counsel for the class in Morrison v. Family Automotive 
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Group, etc., et al. (Super. Ct. Orange County, 2003, no. 03 CC10141).  The case 

was certified in contested certification motions on April 22, 2005 and again on 

May 12, 2008 (concerning added claims), and it subsequently settled. 

h. I was co-counsel for the class in Hernandez v. Quality Parking 

Service, etc., et al. (Super. Ct. L.A. County, 2006, case no. BC363766).  The case 

was certified in a contested certification motion on January 13, 2009. 

i. I was co-counsel for the class in Bailey v. Haffar & Associates, etc., 

et al. (Super. Ct. Santa Clara County, 2010, case no. 1-10-CV-179515).  The case 

was certified in a contested certification motion on January 13, 2012 and, on 

December 20, 2013, the Court entered judgment exceeding $12,000,000 on 

behalf of the class; it also awarded attorneys’ fees based on my reasonable hourly 

rate of $600. 

5. Since 1999, Martindale Hubbell has given me an AV rating.  (“CV, BV and 

AV are registered certification marks of Reed Elsevier Properties Inc., used in 

accordance with the Martindale-Hubbell certification procedures, standards and 

policies.”)  According to Martindale Hubbell, “Legal Ability Ratings” take into 

consideration the standard of professional ability in the area where the lawyer practices, 

the lawyer’s expertise, and other professional qualifications.  Legal Ability Ratings are:  

C – Good to High, B – High to Very High, and A – Very High to Preeminent.  The 

General Ethical Standards Rating (“V”) denotes adherence to professional standards of 

conduct and ethics, reliability, diligence and other criteria relevant to the discharge of 

professional responsibilities.  A lawyer will not receive a Legal Ability Rating unless he 

or she has been endorsed for a “V.”  A CV Rating is an excellent first Rating and a 

statement of a lawyer’s above average ability and very high ethics.  A BV Rating is an 

indication of an exemplary reputation and well-established practice.  A typical BV-rated 

lawyer is in mid-career, with a significant client base and high professional standing.  

An AV Rating shows that a lawyer has reached the height of professional excellence.  

He or she has usually practiced law for many years, and is recognized for the highest 
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levels of skill and integrity.  

6. My practice is to be dogged in pursuit of specific case-related information.  

Because of the small chance that this case could return to litigation, I will not reveal all of 

what I have done in this case; however, as part of my background research and 

preparation, I: 

a. read articles written by defense counsel about the CIPA; 

b. reviewed telephone monitoring and recording technology development 

from speakerphones to state-of-the art voice recording and recognition 

software used by Defendant; 

c. studied CIPA’s genesis as well as the tariffing, its rules, and its exceptions;  

d. spoke with retired California Public Utility Commission Executive 

Director Joseph E. Bodovitz, who (in 1983) signed California Public 

Utilities Commission General Order 107-B (on which General Order 

Defendant relied as a defense); 

e. consulted with experts who deal with tariffs, databases, locating recipients 

of phone calls (even wrong numbers), and other attorneys who handle 

cases involving CIPA (including cases defended by these defense 

counsel); and  

f. researched administrative opinions, statutes, regulations, rules, and tariffs 

nationwide (because there was no California precedent on whether beep 

tones provide notice outside of the tariff context). 

7. Hours Reasonably Expended:  As of September 25, 2017, I had expended a 

total of 922.7 hours in prosecuting this case, as detailed in the ledger attached as Exhibit A.  

I believe, based on my experience, all of the time was necessary to pursuing this case.  My 

time included, for instance, extensively meeting and conferring on discovery by letter, by 

phone, and even in person.  My hours do not include time involved in preparing this motion 

or time that will be involved with further motions or appearances beyond this date; neither 

do they include time associated with Elias I.  Because of my engagement on this case, I did 
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not accept opportunities to take other legal work. 

8. Reasonable Hourly Rate:  Virtually all of my work on behalf of consumers 

and employees is contingent, and I do not charge hourly for it.  When I do bill an hourly rate 

it, it is for public entity person injury defense, and my customary hourly rate for that non-

contingent work is $250.  Based on my experience litigating collective and class action class 

actions, I submit that a reasonable hourly rate for my work in this case is $600. 

9. James Elias values his privacy.  Should the court indicate that it will make a 

difference, he is willing to file, under seal, a doctor’s report concerning his health.  

Throughout this litigation, I have spent days with James Elias and talked with him 

frequently.  Despite his age and ill-health, he chose to be integrally involved in this 

litigation including attending the first day of mediation.  After observing his mobility 

challenges, I told him it was not necessary for him to attend the second day of mediation – 

although I knew he would have tried.  

10. Mr. Kozic also values his privacy.  He was surprised, embarrassed, and 

offended that his telephone conversations with Synchrony were recorded.  Before he was 

added to this litigation, he voluntarily opted-in to share his private information.  He 

continued to cooperate with Plaintiff’s counsel, and he actively took part in the litigation, 

including being deposed and becoming a named Plaintiff. 

11. After the settlement number was reached, Defendant asked if there would be a 

request for an enhancement fee for class representatives.  Plaintiffs’ counsel responded that 

we would seek $10,000 for Mr. Elias and $5000 for Mr. Kozik.  (We had earlier rejected a 

$30,000 statutory offer for Elias to settle on an individual basis.)  We also indicated that 

Mr. Kozik was being added as a named Plaintiff – our goal being to preclude a res judicata 

defense since his first notification of the otherwise secret recording came from (or after) the 

April 11, 2016, Belaire-West notice. 

12. As of September 21, 2017 (the date of the Administrator’s latest report), seven 

percent (9503) of the class had submitted claims; 2 opted out, and none objected; the 

estimated claims rate was three percent, increasing the administration cost.  The 
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Administrator’s estimated cost at completion is between $106,106.34 and $116,306.34. 

 

I declare under penalty of perjury, under the laws of the State of California, that the 

foregoing is true and correct.   

 

Dated:  September 29, 2017     /s/        
Jonathan Weiss 
 

  



  
  
  
  
  
  

  
  

Exhibit "A" 



Law Office of Jonathan Weiss TIMESHEET 
Jonathan Weiss 
 
10576 Troon Avenue 
Los Angeles, California  90064-4436 
310.558.0404 
jw@lojw.com 
 
 

Date Task Hours 

June 21, 2014 Receive and review discovery including recording of Elias 5 

June 23, 2014 Researching and writing State Court Complaint 7.2 

June 24, 2014 Researching and writing State Court Complaint 4 

June 26, 2014 Emails (3) with Borison & Holland about co-counseling .2 

June 30, 2014 Emails (5) with Berke, Borison & Holland re Borison & Holland about co-
counseling; Emails (3) re FFA 

.5 

July 2, 2014 Emails (10) with Co-counsel re State Court Complaint and associated issues .6 

“ Preliminarily Research Pro hac vice .2 

July 3, 2014 Research & emails (17) re pro hac vice; Research FFA & State Court 
Complaint; Revise State Court Complaint; Call with co-counsel 

8.9 

July 6, 2014 Research & revise State Court Complaint 5.5 

July 7, 2014 Emails (7) re conference call with Co-counsel .2 

July 8, 2014 Emails (7) with & Conference call with all co-counsel; Call with Scott Borison 1.5 

July 14, 2014 R&R Holland’s revisions to State Court Complaint; Revise; Other Emails (4) 
with co-counsel 

1.9 

July 16, 2014 Emails (4) re revising & filing State Court Complaint .3 

July 17, 2014 Email from Berke .1 

July 24, 2014 Email from Berke re pro hac vice .3 

August 12, 2014 Emails (2) with Berke re State Court Complaint .2 

August 18, 2014 Emails (2) with Berke re Client .2 

August 20, 2014 Review & Revise State Court Complaint; Email to Berke .8 

August 28, 2014 Emails (2) with Berke re Complaint filed; Emails (15) and research re 
assignment & peremptory challenge 

2.2 

August 29, 2014 Review filed complaint; Email Berke re filed complaint; Prepare and file 
Peremptory Challenge 

.8 

September 2, 2014 Research and send law memo to co-counsel; emails (5) re filing and service 
of complaint 

1.7 

September 3, 2014 Email defense attorney re accepting service of complaint .1 

September 8, 2014 Emails (4) re service of complaint and email (1) to co-counsel re procedural .4 



September 14, 2014 Emails (2) with co-counsel re pro hac vice  .2 

September 15, 2014 Phone call & email from Ed Totino; Email documents to Totino; Research 
Defense Counsel; Emails (7) with co-counsel  

1.9 

September 16, 2014 Research and memo on certification case law; emails (2) with Berke re 
factual investigation; email with co-counsel re Totino 

3.2 

September 17, 2014 Send Notice and Acknowledgment of Receipt; Emails (3) with Totino 
including research; Emails (4) with Berke; Phone call with Borison 

1.8 

September 18, 2014 Receive, review & forward Minute Order on Peremptory Challenge; emails 
(2) with Totino; research and revise pro hac vice papers & emails (6) with co-

counsel 

3.1 

September 19, 2014 Receive, review & forward Minute Order on Reassignment; emails (2) with 
Totino; email co-counsel re pro hac vice 

.5 

September 22, 2014 Emails (2) with Totino; Emails (3) with Co-counsel .3 

September 23, 2014 Emails (13) with Co-counsel; Working on Pro Hac Vice; Researching 
Discovery; Call with all co-counsel, including preparation 

3.3 

September 24, 2014 File Notice and Acknowledgment of Receipt; Working on Co-Counsel 
Agreement and Related; Emails (7) with Co-counsel 

1.9 

September 25, 2014 Call with Michael re strategy; Emails (2) with Borison .8 

September 26, 2014 Research Pro Hac Vice fees; Emails (2) with Co-counsel .4 

September 27, 2014 Emails (6) with Co-counsel; Reviewing their research and following up 2.5 

September 28, 2014 Emails(2) and research re Precedent and following new cases .6 

September 29, 2014 Emails (10) re conference with Co-counsel; review research from Peter 
Holland; File Pro Hac Vice Application; Calendar further Pro Hac Vice 

Applications; Prepare proposed order 

3.4 

October 1, 2014 Email with third party attorney; research and email Berke re preference .7 

October 2, 2014 Research removal/remand & CAFA; Phone call with Berke re strategy & 
status 

.8 

October 3, 2014 Receive and Review court order re newly filed class action and initial status 
conference order & serve on Defendant; File & Serve proof of service of court 
order re newly filed class action and initial status conference order Research 

removal/remand; File & Serve Notice of Pro Hac Vice Order; review prior 
research; emails (7) with and Conference call with co-counsel 

1.5 

October 4, 2014 Receive & Review Pro Hac Vice Order; Email Holland re Order .2 

October 6, 2014 Email Berke re financing .2 

October 11, 2014 Emails (3) with Holland re Bank Litigation; Read Article; Research 1.5 

October 14, 2014 Email Berke re Removal research; Email re costs  .4 

October 17, 2014 Emails (15) re conference requested by Defendant’s attorney .4 

October 19, 2014 Emails (2) with Holland re recent case including review .4 



October 20, 2014 Pre-conference call with Scott Borison; Conference call with Defense 
Attorneys; Post-conference call with Scott & Michael; Emails (13) re 

conference call & stipulation to more time to respond, including reviewing 
stipulation; Emails (2) re Addendum to retainer agreement 

1.5 

October 21, 2014 Phone calls to counsel on similar(?) recording case; Receive and Review 
removal papers & legal research; emails (15) re removal; legal research re 

removal & related matters   

6.3 

October 22, 2014 Call with Scott re remand motion; Emails (3) between Totino & Berke re 
stipulation; Receive and Review Stipulation; emails (3) on removal law; 

emails (2) to set up conference call 

3.2 

October 23, 2014 Call with Peter Holland re remand motion .1 

October 24, 2014 Emails (7) re draft remand motion; Receive and Review co-counsel’s drafts; 
Email Defense counsel for meet and confer time 

1.7 

October 25, 2014 Emails (4) re remand motion drafts and precedent 1.4 

October 27, 2014 Emails (7) with co-counsel re remand motion drafts & call with Defense 
counsel; Emails (3) with Defense counsel; Call with Borison re remand 

motion 

3.5 

October 28, 2014 Receive and Review Transfer Order; Email (3) with Defense counsel re 
transfer & scheduling; Call with Borison re remand motion; motion to dismiss; 

email (12) with re remand motion drafts and precedent 

2.2 

October 29, 2014 Call and Emails with Lexis re remand motion; Emails (3) re remand motion 
drafts and precedent; email between Totino & Borison 

.3 

November 3, 2014 Emails (3) with co-counsel re remand motion drafts .3 

November 4, 2014 Receive and Review Minute Order re Order to Show Cause re Removal; 
Research & Emails re OSC & 632.7 precedent; Call with Borison re OSC; 

Call with Berke re OSC 

2.7 

November 5, 2014 Research timeliness of removal; email Borison .4 

November 18, 2014 Receive and Review Court’s notice that Response filed by Defendant 
Synchrony Bank to Minutes of In Chambers Order/Directive; Research, email 

(9) & calls with co-counsel re responding 

2.8 

November 20, 2014 Email from potential expert & emails (2) with co-counsel re  .3 

November 21, 2014 Emails (3) with Defense counsel re scheduling motion to dismiss; Emails (3) 
with co-counsel re scheduling motion to dismiss 

.5 

November 24, 2014 Emails (3) with co-counsel re responding on OSC .3 

November 25, 2014 Emails (4) with co-counsel re responding on OSC and scheduling motion to 
dismiss 

.3 

November 26, 2014 Receive, review & calendar Court’s notice that Motion to Dismiss Case filed 
by Defendant Synchrony Bank 

.3 

December 3, 2014 Review & Email Deadlines to Co-counsel .4 

December 10, 2014 Emails (4) with Berke re Retainer Agreement .2 

December 24, 2014 Emails (3) with co-counsel re precedent & OSC .3 

January 4, 2015 Email co-counsel with draft remand motion .2 



January 5, 2015 Emails (3) with co-counsel re draft remand motion; review drafts & share 
analysis of precedent 

1.5 

January 6, 2015 Emails (2) with co-counsel re draft remand motion & revise .7 

January 7, 2015 Emails (3) with co-counsel re draft remand motion & revise .7 

January 8, 2015 Finalize, File & Serve Remand Motion; Email from Court confirming Notice Of 
Motion And Motion to Remand Case to Los Angeles Superior Court filed by 

plaintiff James E. Elias and returning proposed order 

1.2 

January 9, 2015 Receive and Review Email from Court – Order remanding & denying motion 
to dismiss; email co-counsel re Order and fees 

.3 

January 10, 2015 Email (2) with co-counsel re scheduling .2 

January 11, 2015 Email (2) with co-counsel re scheduling .2 

January 12, 2015 Email (6) with co-counsel re Joint Initial Status Conference Class Action 
Response Statement; Call with Co-counsel; Call to & Email from Case 

Anywhere & review its Order & Rate Schedule 

1.5 

January 13, 2015 Email (2) with Totino re Joint Initial Status Conference Class Action 
Response Statement; Email with & review “File & ServeXpress” terms; Email 

co-counsel re Conference with Totino 

.5 

January 14, 2015 Email from “File & ServeXpress”; Review docket; Email (3) with Totino re 
scheduling; Call Clerk re getting case moving again; Email Co-counsel 

.5 

January 15, 2015 Receive and Review Email from Court – Order denying Remand Motion as 
Moot 

.2 

January 21, 2015 Revise Joint Initial Status Conference Class Action Response Statement & 
email to Co-counsel with explanation 

1.6 

January 23, 2015 Email co-counsel re Joint Initial Status Conference Class Action Response 
Statement & informing them of status; Outlining Causes of Action xx 

.3 

January 26, 2015 Email Totino Draft Joint Initial Status Conference Class Action Response 
Statement 

.2 

January 27, 2015 Receive and Review Notice from Court re Receipt of Letter of Transmittal - 
Remand to Superior Court; Email (2) with Totino re Meeting 

.3 

January 28, 2015 Meet with Defense Counsel; Report to Co-Counsel 3.0 

February 2, 2015 Receive, Review & Calendar Minute Order resetting calendar Initial Status 
Conference; Email (5) re Initial Status Conference 

.5 

February 9, 2015 Emails (3) with Berke re Complaint .2 

February 10, 2015 Research & Email (3) with Co-counsel re Amending Complaint 1.9 

February 16, 2015 Research & Email (6) with Co-counsel re Amending Complaint 2.2 

February 17, 2015 Research & Email (2) with Co-counsel re Other Claims shown in Defendant’s 
Public Filings; Email Berke re Fraudster Threatte 

1.5 

February 19, 2015 Phone call with Peter Holland; Email Holland re Amending the Complaint 1.1 

February 20, 2015 Email Berke re Factual Investigation; Email Co-counsel with draft Amended 
Complaint  

.5 

February 23, 2015 Email Co-counsel re draft Amended Complaint .1 



February 24, 2015 Prepare, File & Serve Plaintiff’s Notice of Order Resetting Initial Status 
Conference; Email (5) with Co-counsel re draft Amended Complaint 

.8 

February 25, 2015 Email (3) Co-counsel re Conference Call .2 

February 26, 2015 Email (5) with Co-counsel re draft Amended Complaint; Review & Discuss 
Precedent 

2.9 

February 27, 2015 Teleconference with co-counsel; Emails re Teleconference & follow-up 1.3 

February 28, 2015 Email (5) with Co-counsel re draft Amended Complaint .9 

March 1, 2015 Email (5) with Co-counsel re draft Amended Complaint 1.5 

March 2, 2015 Email (9) with Co-counsel re draft Amended Complaint & Other Matters 1.1 

March 3, 2015 Email Counsel in Another Case for Information on Theirs .4 

March 9, 2015 Email to Totino re Joint Statement .2 

March 12, 2015 Email from Monica Scott re Joint Statement .1 

March 30, 2015 Email from Monica Scott with Joint Statement; Review & Email (6) with Co-
counsel and Defense Counsel re Modifications to Joint Statement 

1.6 

March 31, 2015 Read & Email Co-counsel about other illegal recording cases .8 

April 1, 2015 Review & Email (5) with Co-counsel and Defense Counsel re Modifications to 
Joint Statement 

.4 

April 1, 2015 Email from Defense counsel with Signature Pages .2 

April 13, 2015 Email (3) co-counsel re attending status conference .2 

April 17, 2015 Prepare for and Appear at Status Conference; Receive and Review Order 
Authorizing Electronic Service; File First Amended Complaint 

3.5 

April 19, 2015 Email Report to Co-counsel on Appearance and Related 1.2 

April 20, 2015 Email CaseAnywhere re Applicable Orders and Stipulation; Draft Stipulation; 
Call with CaseAnywhere; Emails (4) with CaseAnywhere and Defense 

Counsel re Stipulation and Service 

1.6 

April 21, 2015 Email (3) with Defense Counsel re Stipulation; Email (3) with CaseAnywhere; 
Email (4) with Co-counsel re Service and Case 

.9 

April 22, 2015 Email (5) with Peter Holland re Research & reviewing; Email (4) with 
CaseAnywhere and Co-Counsel re Service; Serving Stipulation 

1.8 

May 8, 2015 Email from Peter Holland re Research; Email (2) with CaseAnywhere .7 

May 11, 2015 Email (3) with Berke re Res Judicata and Collateral Estoppel .5 

May 16, 2015 Email from Monica Scott re Demurrer Date; Email Co-counsel .2 

May 17, 2015 Email (2) with Co-counsel re Demurrer Date .2 

May 18, 2015 Email re Demurrer Date; Calendar Dates; Research Options for Expediting 
and Report to Co-Counsel; Email outline to Co-counsel; Receive and Review 

Demurrer and Related Documents & Research 

5.9 

May 26, 2015 Email Borison & Holland for Access to Treatise .2 

May 27, 2015 Email from Holland with Treatise; Review & Respond  .5 

June 3, 2015 Email (3) with Administrator re Status .2 



June 9, 2015 Email Co-counsel re Precedent and with Draft Opposition 7.2 

July 3, 2015 Research and Report to co-counsel re 998; Email draft Opposition to 
Demurrer 

1.1 

July 5, 2015 Email from Borison; Writing Opposition 6.1 

July 8, 2015 Emails (2) with co-counsel re precedent .3 

July 14, 2015 Emails confirming service of Objection to 998; Email (4) with co-counsel re 
draft of Opposition to Demurrer; File & Serve Objection to Offer to 

Compromise 

.6 

July 16, 2015 Email from Holland re information source .3 

July 23, 2015 Research & Email to co-counsel re Remedies .5 

July 26, 2015 Email from CaseAnywhere .1 

August 13, 2015 Email (7) with Defense counsel re changing hearing date; messages (2) on 
CaseAnywhere re changing hearing date; communicate with co-counsel re 

changing dates 

.5 

August 16, 2015 Revise opposition to demurrer; emails (2) with co-counsel re opposition to 
demurrer 

3.9 

August 18, 2015 File & Serve opposition to demurrer .3 

August 19, 2015 Email (2) with co-counsel re hearing date .2 

August 20, 2015 Emails (5) with Berke & Elias re Pleadings .5 

August 31, 2015 Emails (3) with Berke re Pleadings; Receive and Review Reply re Opposition 
to Demurrer & Research 

2.2 

September 8, 2015 Emails (6) with Court & CaseAnywhere re First Amended Complaint .3 

September 10, 2015 Emails (5) with co-counsel re recent authority & demurrer hearing .5 

September 12, 2015 Email (2) with Borison re demurrer hearing .1 

September 14, 2015 Research & analyze authority re demurrer; emails (4) with co-counsel re 
analysis 

3.2 

September 15, 2015 Pickup & dropoff & meet with Scott Borison re demurrer hearing; Attend 
hearing; Email (5) re hearing; Receive and Review Minute Order re Demurrer 

Hearing 

7.4 

September 16, 2015 Email Holland re Pro Hac Vice Renewal .1 

September 20, 2015 Email re reporter transcript .1 

September 21, 2015 Email (5) re reporter transcript; read transcript .5 

September 22, 2015 Email (2) re reporter transcript; Notice of Lodging .2 

September 29, 2015 Email (4) with Holland re Pro Hac Vice Fee .2 

September 30, 2015 Email (3) & Minute Order re renewal fees for the Pro Hac Vice Application of 
Peter A. Holland; Call Court 

.4 

October 1, 2015 Email (2) with Holland’s office re Pro Hac Vice Fee .1 

October 7, 2015 Receive and Review Ruling on Demurrer .4 



October 8, 2015 Email (6) with Co-counsel re Ruling on Demurrer; Further Review Ruling on 
Demurrer & Discuss with Co-counsel; Email with source; Review & Discuss 

Ruling on Demurrer with Co-counsel; Prepare & Email Co-counsel with 
Discovery Plan 

3.6 

October 9, 2015 Email (2) with co-counsel re class representative; Phone Call with Berke re 
Litigation Options; Research & Report to Co-counsel 

7.2 

October 13, 2015 Email (2) with co-counsel re potential appellate review .1 

October 14, 2015 Research & Email co-counsel re class representatives .6 

October 15, 2015 Email (4) with co-counsel re clarifying procedural issues .3 

October 16, 2015 Email defense counsel with procedural questions .2 

October 19, 2015 Email (2) co-counsel re recent authority; Email (2) with defense counsel with 
procedural questions; Email co-counsel re defense counsel’s response to 

procedural questions 

.5 

October 20, 2015 Call court clerk re procedural questions; Email (11) with co-counsel re 
resolving procedural questions; post message to Court re resolving 

procedural questions; receive Defendant’s post in response; respond to 
Defendant’s post in response 

2.9 

October 22, 2015 Email from Case Anywhere .1 

October 23, 2015 Email (2) re Case Anywhere .1 

October 26, 2015 Call to Court Clerk .1 

October 27, 2015 Email Report to Co-counsel .7 

October 28, 2015 Email (6) with Co-counsel .3 

October 29, 2015 Post message; Emails (3) with Defense Counsel .3 

November 1, 2015 Phone call to potential source; Email co-counsel re message posting .1 

November 2, 2015 Email (5) with Co-counsel re class representative .4 

November 3, 2015 Email (2) with Co-counsel re class representative .1 

November 4, 2015 Email from co-counsel re precedent .4 

November 5, 2015 Notice from CaseAnywhere re continuance of status conference; call Clerk; 
email (2) with co-counsel; email (4) with defense counsel; Email from co-

counsel re precedent; File and Serve Notice of Continuance 

2.0 

November 6, 2015 Post Case Anywhere message re telephonic conference; email (5) with co-
counsel re precedent and class representative; File & Serve Proof of Service 

of Notice of Order Resetting Status Conference 

.9 

November 10, 2015 Receive & calendar response from Court re telephonic conference .2 

November 11, 2015 Email co-counsel re telephonic conference; Draft & Email (2) with Defense 
counsel re joint statement 

1.5 

November 12, 2015 Meet with Defense Counsel; email (2) Defense Counsel; email report to co-
counsel 

3.2 

November 13, 2015 Email further report to co-counsel .7 

November 16, 2015 Receive and Review Defendant’s revisions to joint statement; revise, email 
counsel, & file and serve 

2.6 



November 18, 2015 Phone conference with Court; Receive, Review & Calendar minute order; 
Email with Co-counsel and Defense Counsel re CFPB Subpoena 

2.9 

November 19, 2015 Email (4) with Co-counsel & research CFPB Subpoena; Email (4) with 
Defense counsel re Protective Order 

1.2 

November 20, 2015 Call with and email consultant; Email Defense Counsel re CFPB subpoena; 
Email (23) & calls with co-counsel re subpoenas; Working on Subpoenas 

6.6 

November 21, 2015 Prepare and email revised subpoena cover letters .8 

November 22, 2015 Email (2) with Berke re subpoenas .3 

November 23, 2015 Email (3) with Berke re subpoenas .3 

November 24, 2015 Email (15) re subpoenas; Call with Service re Subpoenas; Working on 
Subpoenas 

2.9 

November 24, 2015 Email (5) re subpoenas; Call with Berke re Subpoenas; Working on 
Subpoenas 

.7 

November 27, 2015 Email with Case Anywhere and from UPS re subpoenas .3 

December 1, 2015 Email (15) re subpoenas; Call with Berke’s paralegal; Working on Subpoenas 1.5 

December 2, 2015 Email (15) with co-counsel re subpoenas; Email (6) with Case Anywhere re 
subpoenas; serving subpoenas on Defendant; Email (2) with outside 

attorney; Email from Totino re subpoenas 

4.2 

December 3, 2015 Email (2) with Totino re conference; Call with Totino; Email (6) with co-
counsel re subpoenas; Case Anywhere messages to Court 

4.3 

December 4, 2015 Email (3) with co-counsel re service of subpoenas .7 

December 7, 2015 Email (1) with co-counsel re service of subpoenas .1 

December 9, 2015 Email (5) with outside attorney re case; Email (7) with co-counsel & agent re 
service of subpoenas 

1.3 

December 10, 2015 Email (1) with outside attorney re case .1 

December 11, 2015 Receive & Calendar Case Anywhere posts (2) re subpoenas; Call with co-
counsel 

1 

December 12, 2015 Research and send Email to CFPB; Call CFPB 3.1 

December 13, 2015 Email (5) with CFPB .3 

December 14, 2015 Receive and Review letters from Defense Counsel; Receive and Review 
Court posting on CaseAnywhere; Call with CFPB; Call with Borison; Email 

Co-counsel 

2.1 

December 15, 2015 Email (4) with Defense Counsel re third party subpoenas; Receive and 
Review Defendant’s draft status conference statement; Email & discussion 

with co-counsel 

3.3 

December 16, 2016 Email (3) with Defense counsel; Email (5) with co-counsel re discovery and 
strategy; Call with CFPB 

2.9 

December 17, 2015 Call with Borison .2 



December 18, 2015 Email from Holland with precedent; Email (2) with Berke with precedent; 
Email (5) with Defense Counsel; Email (7) from third party re subpoena; 

Email (5) and Research re third party representative; Email (2) with CFPB 
and research 

3.5 

December 19, 2015 Email (3) with CFPB; revise status conference report and related documents 
& email co-counsel; Email (2) re subpoenas 

3.1 

December 21, 2015 Research and Email co-counsel re Privacy Research 3.0 

December 22, 2015 Phone calls and email re privacy theories; CaseAnywhere posts re 
subpoenas; Email with Defense Counsel re Status Conference 

Statement/Belaire-West Notice 

1.3 

December 23, 2015 Receive and Review Motion to Quash; emails (2) with Totino; Drafting and 
emails (3) with co-counsel re Joint Report; Emails (4) with Co-counsel re 

publication 

3.2 

December 24, 2015 Edit and send Joint Report to Borison 1.6 

December 25, 2015 Edit and send Joint Report to co-counsel; Research, Edit, & Send Amended 
Complaint & Motion to Amend to co-counsel 

5.2 

December 26, 2015 Email (2) with Borison re edits .2 

December 27, 2015 Email (3) with Holland re edits .3 

December 28, 2015 Emails (3) with Defense Counsel re Joint Discovery Statement; make 
revisions to Second Amended Complaint and Motion for Leave to Amend & 

email to co-counsel 

3.7 

December 29, 2015 Emails (3) with Defense Counsel re Status Conference Report; Receive and 
Review Joint Statement re: Discovery Dispute 

.9 

December 31, 2015 Emails (3) with Defense Counsel re Status Conference Statement/Belaire-
West Notice 

.3 

January 4, 2016 Email (10) with Defense Counsel re Joint Statement; Revising, filing, & 
serving Status Conference Statement 

3.3 

January 5, 2016 Receive and Review Stipulation and Protective Order-Confidential 
Designation from Court; Research & Discuss Trial Preference with Berke; 

Attend Status Conference; Call with Co-counsel re status conference; Emails 
(4) with Co-counsel re amendment; Emails (2) with Defense Counsel  

5.2 

January 6, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (4) re subpoenas; Email (3) with Berke re his 
review of Discovery; Email with Co-Counsel (4) re subpoenas 

.5 

January 7, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel re subpoenas; Email Third Parties re Subpoenas; 
Finalize & Serve Discovery; Research  

3.3 

January 8, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (6) re Belaire-West and Second Amended 
Complaint; Receive and Review Defendant’s Discovery 

2.5 

January 11, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel re phone conference re Second Amended Complaint; 
Email with Defense Counsel; call with Berke re Elias’ responses to discovery 

.7 

January 12, 2016 Email (5) with Berke re Elias’ responses to discovery; Draft Joint Statement; 
Email with Co-Counsel (2) re Joint Statement; Call with defense counsel 

2.9 

January 13, 2016 Email (3) with Berke re Elias’ responses to discovery & his call with Elias;   .2 



January 15, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (2) re stipulation to file SAC; Research & email 
Outside attorney; Email from Berke re Meeting Elias 

3.6 

January 16, 2016 Email (6) with Outside attorney; Email Defense Counsel; Prepare & serve 
Plaintiff James E. Elias' Demand for Identification and Production of 

Documents, Set Two, to Defendant Synchrony Bank 

3.1 

January 17, 2016 Email with Outside attorney .1 

January 18, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (6); Drafting discovery responses; Email (2) with 
CACH counsel; Email with Berke re meeting Elias; Prepare & serve Plaintiff 
James E. Elias' Demand for Identification and Production of Documents, Set 

Two, Amended, to Defendant Synchrony Bank 

5.5 

January 19, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (24); File & Serve Joint Statement re: Discovery 
Dispute (Belaire-West Notice) 

4.2 

January 20, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (9); Email with Co-Counsel (6); Conference Call 
with Court 

3.3 

January 21, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (3); File & Serve Stipulation to Permit Plaintiff to 
File a Second Amended Complaint & Proposed Order; Serve [Proposed] 

Notice and Order re Discovery Telephonic Conference (Belaire-West Notice); 
Email from Borison; Email from Case Anywhere 

2.5 

January 22, 2016 Call with Borison; Email with Defense Counsel (2); Email from CACH 
counsel; Call with Defense Counsel; Email with Co-Counsel (6) including 

Report to Co-counsel 

3.9 

January 25, 2016 Email (2) from/re Case Anywhere; EDC; Receive and Review Objections (2) 
to "Proposed Notice and Order re Discovery Telephonic Conference (Belaire-

West Notice)" Filed by Plaintiff; Draft, File & Serve Proposed Order re 
Discovery Dispute (Belaire-West Notice); Email (4) with Berke re meeting 

Elias & his call with Elias 

2.3 

January 26, 2016 Email (3) with Berke re meeting Elias; call with Elias .6 

January 29, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (4) .9 

February 1, 2016 Email Defense Counsel re Extension; Email Elias .2 

February 2, 2016 Meet with Elias & Berke; Email from Berke to Defense counsel; Revise & 
Send Elias Discovery Responses; Voicemail from Totino’s secretary re 

deposition; returned call 

4.6 

February 3, 2016 Emails (3) with Elias re Discovery Responses .3 

February 4, 2016 Emails (2) with attorney service .2 

February 5, 2016 Email (6) re deposition location; Email from Borison re Discovery Responses .5 

February 6, 2016 Revise & Email with Co-Counsel re Discovery Responses .5 

February 8, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel .3 

February 9, 2016 Serve discovery responses; prepare deposition notice & Email with Co-
Counsel (5); Receive and Review Defendant’s Discovery Responses; 

Receive and Review amended deposition notice for Elias; Email summary to 
co-counsel 

6.7 

February 10, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (4); Email with Co-Counsel (4)  1.5 



February 11, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (6) re deposition and discovery; Email with Co-
Counsel (4) re research; Email with Defense Counsel with meet & confer 

letter; Phone conference with co-counsel 

2.6 

February 12, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (4) re research; Receive and Review Defendant’s 
document production 

1.5 

February 13, 2016 Writing Meet & Confer Letter & Response to Meet & Confer Letter 3.2 

February 14, 2016 Writing Meet & Confer Letter & Response to Meet & Confer Letter 6 

February 15, 2016 Prepare and serve Plaintiff James E. Elias' Demand for Identification and 
Production of Documents, Set Three, to Defendant Synchrony Bank; Emails 

(2) with Berke re file access 

3.5 

February 16, 2016 Receive and Review Minute Orders & Orders; finalize & submit SAC for filing; 
Receive and Review Defendant’s Draft Belaire-West Notice; Email with Co-

Counsel re Defendant’s Draft Belaire-West Notice; Send Meet & Confer 
Letter & Response to Meet & Confer Letter 

3.2 

February 17, 2016 Prepare for and attend Elias’ Deposition; Email with Co-Counsel (2) re 
deposition 

10.5 

February 18, 2016 Revising Email with Co-Counsel (7) re revised Belaire-West and other 
discovery with analysis; Email third party; Email SAC to Totino 

5.2 

February 19, 2016 Email from Holland re Statute of Limitation; Email with Defense Counsel (3); 
Receive and Review Synchrony Bank's Responses to Amended Demand for 
Identification and Production of Documents, Set Two; Email outside attorney; 

Draft & Email Defense Counsel revised Belaire-West Opt-ins, etc.; Draft & 
serve Plaintiff James E. Elias' Demand for Identification and Production of 
Documents, Set Four, to Defendant Synchrony Bank; Listen to and Email 

Report to Co-counsel re recordings; Email Totino re Recordings 

5.3 

February 22, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel re disc .4 

February 23, 2016 Email (4) with outside attorney; Receive and Review Defendant Synchrony 
Bank's Second Set of Request for Production of Documents to Plaintiff 

James E. Elias; Email from Monica Scott re Belaire-West; Email Co-counsel 

2.9 

February 24, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel re Belaire-West & phone conference; Email with 
CACH’s counsel; Receive and Review letters from Defense Counsel 

2.3 

February 25, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (2) re Discovery Responses; Drafting Discovery 
Responses; Email with Defense Counsel (3) re call 

3.3 

February 26, 2016 Review & Report on deadlines and issues 2.5 

February 27, 2016 Email with Holland re Class Rep; Call with Scott Borison 1.4 

February 29, 2016 Conference call with opposing counsel; Email with Co-Counsel; Email with 
Defense Counsel 

1.7 

March 1, 2016 Email with CACH counsel re discovery; Email with Defense Counsel (4) re 
revising Belaire-West; Email with Defense Counsel re discovery and 

confidentiality and research 

2.3 

March 2, 2016 Call with Scott; Email with Defense Counsel (2); Call with Michael 2.8 

March 3, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (4); Email with Co-Counsel (4) re notice; Email 
with Co-Counsel (3) re research 

2.3 

March 7, 2016 Prepare discovery responses; email Elias 3.9 



March 8, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel, Email with Defense Counsel & email with 
outside attorney re (17) re notice; Research  

3.8 

March 9, 2016 Call with Scott; Email (2) with Elias; Receive and Review Synchrony Bank's 
Supplemental Response to Request for Admission No. 4 & Supplemental 
Response to Form Interrogatory No. 17.1; Email with Defense Counsel re 

Discovery Reponses 

.7 

March 11, 2016 Email from Defense Counsel to Borison .1 

March 12, 2016 Email on Research .2 

March 14, 2016 Message from & Call to Monica Scott; Email from Monica Scott; Email with 
Borison re Administrator 

.7 

March 15, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel; Receive and Review Stipulation & Proposed 
Order; Email Elias 

.5 

March 16, 2016 Meet with Jim Elias; Email with Defense Counsel (4); Email with Co-Counsel; 
Receive and Review Case Anywhere Posting; Receive and Review Signed 

Order on Stipulation 

3.4 

March 18, 2016 Receive and Review Synchrony Bank's Responses to Demand for 
Identification and Production of Documents, Set Three; Responses to 
Demand for Identification and Production of Documents, Set Four; & 

Declaration of Martha Koehler; Email with Defense Counsel (4) re 
Outstanding Items; Receive and Review Demurrer & Motion to Strike; Letter 
to Defense Counsel re Martha Koehler Declaration; Email with Co-Counsel 

(2) re Research  

6.8 

March 21, 2016 Receive and Review Order setting Informal Conference; Research Motion to 
Strike & report to Co-counsel; Post Request for Telephonic Hearing 

regarding Discovery Dispute 

4.1 

March 22, 2016 Receive and Review Court Posting re Request for Telephonic Hearing 
regarding Discovery Dispute 

.2 

March 25, 2016 Receive and Review Defendant’s Documents; Emails (2) to Co-counsel 
Reporting; Researching and Writing Opposition to Demurrer; Call with Dr. 

Jim 

8.1 

March 28, 2016 Emails (2) with potential Administrator; Prepare & Serve Plaintiff's Deposition 
Errata Sheet and Signature; Prepare & Serve Plaintiff James E. Elias' Special 

Interrogatories, Set Two, to Defendant Synchrony Bank; Researching & 
Writing Oppositions 

6.2 

March 29, 2016 Email from Administrator; Researching & Writing Oppositions & Email (3) Co-
Counsel Concerning them with report & for call 

3.2 

March 30, 2016 Receive and Review Synchrony Bank's Supplemental Responses to Special 
Interrogatories Nos. 1, 4 and 5; Voicemail from Jim Elias; Revising 

Oppositions 

1.5 

March 31, 2016 Email Jim Elias; Email with Co-Counsel re conference; Email (3) with 
Administrator & Review 

1.4 

April 1, 2016 Receive and Review Joint Statement Portion from Defendant; Receive and 
Review Letter from Defense Counsel re Koehler Declaration; Conference 

call; Writing Plaintiff’s Portion of Joint Statements; Email with Co-Counsel (2) 
re “to-dos” 

5.6 



April 4, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (4) re Joint Statements; Email Scott re Joint 
Statement; Call with Peter; Writing meet and confer on Synchrony’s March 

18, 2016 responses 

8.2 

April 5, 2016 File & Serve Joint Statement re: Discovery Dispute (Plaintiff's Special 
Interrogatory 27 and Requests for Production 4-6); Receive and Review Joint 

Statement re: Pleading Telephonic Conference; Receive and Review 
Documents from Administrator to review; Emails (10) with Administrator & 

Defense Counsel; Writing & Sending meet and confer on Synchrony’s March 
18, 2016 responses; Communication with Attorney Service; Prepare, File & 
Serve Notice of Lodging Exhibit A to Joint Statement re: Discovery Dispute 

(Plaintiff's Special Interrogatory 27 and Requests for Production 4-6) 

7.9 

April 6, 2016 Email (2) with Administrator .2 

April 7, 2016 Call with Court; Email with Co-Counsel (3) 1.6 

April 8, 2016 Receive and Review Minute Order; Email (2) with Clerk; Email (4) with 
Attorney Service; Email with Co-Counsel (2) 

.9 

April 11, 2016 Email (4) with Administrator & Defense Counsel; Receive, Review & 
Calendar Hearing Dates on Demurrer and Motion to Strike; Receive and 

Review Proposed Order; Email with Co-Counsel re Proposed Order 

1.9 

April 13, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (5); Email with Co-Counsel (3); Receive and 
Review [Proposed] Order re: April 7, 2016 Telephonic Conference 

.8 

April 14, 2016 Receive and Review Order re: April 7, 2016 Telephonic Conference; Email 
Defense Counsel re Outstanding Discovery Issues 

1.5 

April 18, 2016 Email (5) with CaseAnywhere .3 

April 19, 2016 Email from Peter Holland with Research; Receive and Review Weekly Report 
from Administrator 

.7 

April 21, 2016 Email from Peter Holland with Research .5 

April 26, 2016 Receive and Review response to April 5, 2016 meet and confer with privilege 
log; Receive and Review Weekly Report from Administrator; ECC re Weekly 

Report from Administrator 

2.2 

April 29, 2016 Receive and Review Synchrony Bank's Responses to Special interrogatories, 
Set Two; Research Nice Systems; Email (5) with Consultant re Nice 
Systems; Email (2) with Consultant re meeting; Call with Consultant 

6.2 

April 30, 2016 Call to consultant .2 

May 3, 2016 Meet with consultant re databases; Phone call with Peter outlining case and 
status; Email from Peter Holland with research; Receive and Review 

Synchrony Bank Opt In - Weekly Summary Report 

2.7 

May 6, 2016 Receive and Review Letter from Defense Counsel; Research Letter from 
Defense Counsel; Call & Email with Outside attorney; Email with Co-Counsel 

re Letter 

3.9 

May 10, 2016 Email (2) with Outside attorney; Receive and Review Synchrony Bank Opt In 
- Weekly Summary Report; Research & Report to Co-counsel 

4.0 

May 11, 2016 Email (2) with Outside attorney; Email re Opt-in .5 

May 16, 2016 Draft letter & Email with Co-Counsel (4) 1.6 



May 17, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (8); Receive and Review Synchrony Bank Opt In - 
Weekly Summary Report; Receive and Review Opt-ins’ Information; Call with 

Scott 

2.1 

May 18, 2016 Call with Peter; Call with Michael re Opt-ins and strategy and motions; Call 
with Dr. Elias to update; Email with Administrator re Opt-ins; Draft & Serve 

Interrogatories and Requests for Production; Write & Email Discovery Letter 
to Defense Counsel; Email with Co-Counsel; Email (3) with Berke; Call Opt-

in; Call Elias; Call with Opt-in 

7.2 

May 19, 2016 Email (5) with Administrator; Emails (3) with Berke’s office re scheduling; 
Email from Holland; Editing Oppositions 

4.5 

May 20, 2016 Emails (4) with Berke .2 

May 21, 2016 Emails (5) with Co-counsel including research .5 

May 23, 2016 Voicemail; Email & Call with Scott to Update .3 

May 24, 2016 Receive and Review Synchrony Bank Opt In - Weekly Summary Report; 
Receive and Review Opt-in Info from Administrator 

1.5 

May 31, 2016 Emails (7) with Administrator including reports & declaration reviews 1.0 

June 1, 2016 Receive and Review Synchrony Bank Opt In - Weekly Summary Report; 
Receive and Review Opt-in Info from Administrator 

.8 

June 2, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (2) re report/analysis 1.9 

June 6, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel re research; Email with Elias re research .3 

June 7, 2016 Receive and Review letter from Defense Counsel with & re discovery; Email 
with Co-Counsel (7) re production/letter & co-counsel’s analysis of discovery; 

Email consultant re production/letter; Email with Co-Counsel re class 
definition & research 

4.9 

June 8, 2016 Email (4) with consultant re production/letter; Email Co-counsel re consultant 1.0 

June 9, 2016 Email from Consultant re Discovery .2 

June 10, 2016 Draft interrogatories; Email with Co-Counsel re draft interrogatories; Email 
with Co-Counsel (7) re oppositions to demurrer and motion to strike; Write & 

Email letter to Monica Scott 

7.3 

June 12, 2016 Email from Co-counsel re discovery .3 

June 13, 2016 Email from Holland with precedent; Email with Co-Counsel and Consultant 
(5) re discovery; Revise discovery 

.8 

June 14, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (2) re revised discovery; Revise & Serve Plaintiff 
James E. Elias' Special Interrogatories, Set Four, to Defendant Synchrony 

Bank 

1.5 

June 21, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (5) re Discovery Reponses; Receive and 
Review Synchrony Bank's Responses to Plaintiff's Demand for Identification 
and Production of Documents, Set Five & Responses to Plaintiff's Special 
Interrogatories, Set Three; Report to Co-counsel on discovery responses; 

Write & email with co-counsel (8) re draft letter to opt-ins 

2.9 

June 22, 2016 Send Borison Synchrony Bank's Responses to Special Interrogatories, Set 
Three; Email with Borison; Email Opt-ins; Call with Opt-in; Email Monica 

Scott re Opt-in Releasing Information; Email to an Opt-in 

3.2 



June 23, 2016 Email (2) with Administrator; Email to Opt-ins 1.3 

June 24, 2016 Email (2) with Kozik; Email (2) with Administrator .7 

June 26, 2016 Emails (2); voicemail and call with Kozik; voicemail from another opt-in; Call 
with Opt-in 

1.2 

June 27, 2017 Email (3) with Administrator; Email (2) from opt-ins; Email with Defense 
Counsel (5); Write & Send meet & confer letter; Call with Opt-in 

6.2 

June 28, 2016 Call with Opt-in; Email from Opt-in; Email Report to Co-counsel; Call with 
Scott 

1 

June 29, 2016 Emails (6) with Borrison re Oppositions; Writing Oppositions 5.3 

June 30, 2016 Emails (4) re Research; Research and Writing Oppositions; Drafting & Email 
with Co-Counsel re Oppositions; Email with Defense Counsel (2) re Opt-in 

Consent Language 

6.8 

July 1, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (4) re Opt-in Consent Language; Email with Co-
Counsel (7); Messages (2) re Request for Telephonic Hearing regarding 

Discovery Dispute 

.9 

July 5, 2016 Receive, Review & Calendar Order from Court setting  Telephonic Hearing 
regarding Discovery Dispute; Email with Co-Counsel; Email with Defense 

Counsel (2) 

.6 

July 6, 2016 Write and Send Defense Counsel Plaintiff’s Portion of Joint Statement; 
Emails (10) with Borison re Revisions to Oppositions & Revise 

5.6 

July 7, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (2) re opt-ins; Email with Co-Counsel (7) re revisions 
and hearing 

2.2 

July 9, 2016 Research & Email Borison re hearing .8 

July 11, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (3) re joint statement & Receive and Review 
Defendant’s portion; Email with Co-Counsel re joint statement & oppositions 

& revise oppositions 

3 

July 12, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (3) re joint statement; Receive and Review 
Defendant’s letter re discovery; Email with Co-Counsel re Defendant’s letter 

2.9 

July 13, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (3); Email from Borison re Opposition .5 

July 14, 2016 File & Serve Joint Report re Notarizing Releases; Email with Co-Counsel re 
class definition 

.8 

July 18, 2016 Receive & Calendar Order from Court Continuing Teleconference; Email with 
Co-Counsel re another opt-in; Email (2) with Opt-in; Receive and Review 

Synchrony Bank's Responses to Plaintiff's Special Interrogatories, Set Four; 
Email with Co-Counsel (4) re discovery responses 

2.6 

July 19, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (4) re discovery responses; Call from Opt-in; Email (4) 
with Berke re Opt-in 

1.3 

July 20, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel .2 

July 21, 2016 Finalize & serve oppositions  3.5 

July 25, 2016 Email (3) with CaseAnywhere .3 

July 29, 2016 Receive and Review research from Holland .3 

July 30, 2016 Email Co-counsel re Hearing .1 



August 1, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (10) re Hearing .4 

August 4, 2016 Receive Notice and Replies to Court’s Notice Continuing Hearing Time & 
Calendar 

.3 

August 5, 2016  Receive and Review opt-in stipulation & email co-counsel 
concerning it 

.3 

August 11, 2016 Receive and Review Defendant’s Replies re Demurrer & Motion to Strike .5 

August 13, 2016 Email Co-counsel re stipulation; Email CaseAnywhere; Email from Holland re 
research 

.3 

August 15, 2016 Email (9) with CaseAnywhere; Email (2) with Co-counsel re stipulation; Email 
with Defense Counsel (5) re stipulation; 

1.6 

August 16, 2016 Receive and Review Service of Stipulation and Proposed Order; Research 
Notaries and Email Opt-in re Stipulation; Left messages for two Opt-ins  

.5 

August 17, 2016 Research Notaries and Email (4) Opt-ins re Stipulation; Email (3) with Kozik; 
Call with Opt-in; Leave message for another opt-in 

2.1 

August 18, 2016 Receive and Review Order Granting Stipulation Concerning Notarizing of 
Consent to Release Personal Financial Information; Research Notary and 

Email Opt-in re Stipulation; Email (3) with Kozik 

1.3 

August 19, 2016 Email from Kozik; Voicemail from and call to Opt-in; Receive and Review 
message from Court to upload SAC; Upload SAC; Call with Opt-in 

2.1 

August 21, 2016 Email (4) with Borison re hearing; Email (2) with opt-ins; Call with Opt-in .8 

August 22, 2016 Email with opt-in; Email with Kozik; Email with Defense Counsel re consent; 
Call with Opt-in 

1.2 

August 23, 2016 Email with opt-in & research; Email with Kozik; Research & Email co-counsel 
with report 

1 

August 24, 2016 Receive and ReviewReceive, Review & Calendar Notice of Continuance of 
Demurrer Hearing; Email with Co-Counsel re Notice; Calls to Department; 
Post message on CaseAnywhere; Receive and ReviewReceive, Review & 

Calendar Message from Courtroom Assistant & Reply; Receive and Review 
Message from Defense Counsel; Message Court re Continuance; Call from 

Opt-in 

1.1 

August 25, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (7) re continuance & stipulation; Email Opt-in .9 

August 26, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (3) re continuance & stipulation .2 

August 29, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel re Certification Motion; Receive and Review 
Stipulation Continuing Hearing on Synchrony's Demurrer and Motion to Strike 

and [Proposed] Order Granting Stipulation Continuing Hearing on 
Synchrony's Demurrer and Motion to Strike 

.8 

August 30, 2016 Receive and Review “Cease and Desist” letter from Defense Counsel; Email 
with Co-Counsel (6) re letter & draft response; Email with Co-Counsel (8) re 
Certification Motion; Email with Co-Counsel (2) re opt-ins; Write & Deliver 

Letter to Monica Scott with notarized opt-ins 

2.5 

August 31, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel; Email with opt-in .3 



September 2, 2016 Receive and Review Order Granting Stipulation Continuing Hearing on 
Synchrony's Demurrer and Motion to Strike; Finalize & email response to 
“cease & desist” letter; Voicemail from Berke; Email defense counsel with 

objections to confidentiality designation; Call Court re Scheduling & Report to 
Co-counsel  

2.2 

September 6, 2016 Call & Email opt-in; Call two other opt-ins; Research & report to Co-counsel  .6 

September 9, 2016 Receive and Review & research Letter from Defense Counsel .5 

September 10, 2016 Responding to Defendant’s attorney’s letter .5 

September 12, 2016 Receive and Review Letter from Defense Counsel; Write & send letter to 
Defense Counsel; Email with Co-Counsel 

1.6 

September 13, 2016 Email from outside attorney; Email defense counsel; Drafting and forwarding 
certification motion to co-counsel; call with Clerk re scheduling certification 

motion; Email with Co-Counsel re certification motion 

3.9 

September 14, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel re strategy and decisions; Call & Email report to 
outside attorney; Call CFPB 

1.3 

September 15, 2016 Receive and Review Letter from Defense Attorney; Email with Defense 
Counsel (6); Receive and Review Case Anywhere message from Defense 

Counsel; Respond to Case Anywhere message from Defense Counsel; 
Email with Co-Counsel (3) 

2.2 

September 16, 2016 Research Experts; Email outside attorneys for research; Email with Defense 
Counsel (2) 

1.5 

September 18, 2016 Email (2) questions from Holland re Elias Deposition .1 

September 20, 2016 Email (5) with Holland re Pro Hac Vice; Prepare Forms .7 

September 22, 2016 Email with Borrison re Certification Motion; Receive and ReviewReceive, 
Review & Calendar Notice of Changed Hearing Time & Respond to Court; 

Email (3) with Administrator; Email with Co-Counsel (3) 

1 

September 23, 2016 Receive and Review Defendant’s Case Anywhere Posting; Receive and 
Review Defendant’s Confirmation re Changed Hearing Time; Research and 

Contact Expert & Email Expert; Email Holland re Pro Hac Vice 

2.1 

September 24, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (3); Email with Defense Counsel re production .5 

September 26, 2016 Email with Expert; Receive and Review Defendant’s production; Email report 
to co-counsel; Call with Court; Email Defense Counsel 

2.6 

September 28, 2016 Email (2) with Administrator; Email to Opt-in and to Kozik 1.2 

September 29, 2016 Email release to defense counsel; Email from Expert; Research, write & 
Email with Co-Counsel re Certification Motion 

3.3 

September 30, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (8) re Totino & Demurrer Hearing; Email from Totino; 
Email with Opt-in 

1.5 

October 1, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (4) re research .6 

October 4, 2016 Letter from Defense Counsel; Report to Co-counsel 1 

October 5, 2016 Email from Totino re mediation; Email with Co-Counsel (4) re mediation & 
research 

.6 

October 6, 2016 Receive and Review document from Kozik; Email Kozik discovery .8 



October 10, 2016 Email Borison re Hearing .1 

October 12, 2016 Email (2) with Expert; Receive and Review Tentative & Report to Co-counsel 3.5 

October 13, 2016 Prepare for Hearing; Meet with Borison & Attend Hearing; Receive and 
Review Minute Order and Calendar; Email Totino re outstanding discovery 

5.3 

October 14, 2016 Receive and Review Synchrony’s joint statement re: motion for protective 
order; Email with Defense Counsel re joint statements; writing and revising 

joint statements 

1 

October 15, 2016 Email Defense Counsel with revised joint statement 2.3 

October 17, 2016 Receive and Review Defendant’s portion of Joint Statement & Email with 
Defense Counsel (7) re Joint Statement; Receive and Review Joint Report; 
Email Defense Counsel about missing documents in Joint Statement; Email 
Administrator; Receive and Review Notice of Errata Regarding Joint Report 

re: Telephonic Discovery Conference 

2.3 

October 18, 2016 Receive and Review & Email with Defense Counsel (8) re Stipulation on 
Certification Briefing Schedule; Conference with Court; Email with Co-

Counsel re Report on Hearing 

3 

October 19, 2016 Receive and Review Minute Order; Email Peter Holland; Receive and 
Review Stipulation re: Class Certification Briefing Schedule & [Proposed] 
Order Granting Stipulation re: Class Certification Briefing Schedule; Email 

Defense Counsel with availability; Email Raphael & Co-counsel 

2.2 

October 20, 2016 Email from CaseAnywhere; Researching  5.1 

October 21, 2016 Call with Lance Raphael; Email with Co-Counsel (4) re Raphael and other 
matters; Email Elias; Researching and Drafting Plaintiff James E. Elias' 

Special Interrogatories, Set Five, to Defendant Synchrony Bank 

7.5 

October 24, 2016 Serve Plaintiff James E. Elias' Special Interrogatories, Set Five, to Defendant 
Synchrony Bank; Email from Administrator; Email from Totino re Mediation 

.5 

October 25, 2016 Receive and Review Order Granting Stipulation Re: Class Certification 
Briefing Schedule; Email from Totino re Mediation & Calendar; Receive and 

Review Court's Ruling and Order Re: Defendant Synchrony Bank's Demurrer 
to Second Amended; Receive and Review Defendant Synchrony Bank's 

Third Set of Request for Production of Documents to Plaintiff James E. Elias 
&  Defendant Synchrony Bank's Second Set of Special Interrogatories to 

Plaintiff James E. Elias; Email with Co-Counsel (4) 

1.7 

October 26, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (6) re call .3 

October 27, 2017 Email with Co-Counsel (3) re call .1 

October 28, 2017 Email with Co-Counsel re call .1 

October 31, 2017 Email with Co-Counsel (8) re call; Revising Certification Motion 4.3 

November 2, 2017 Email with Co-Counsel re call; Call with Co-counsel; Email with Co-Counsel 
(5) following up; Email Defense Counsel re Numerosity; Email (3) with JAMS 

2.5 

November 4, 2016 Receive and ReviewReceive, Review & Calendar Notice of Taking 
Deposition of James Kozik; Research and Email with Co-Counsel re 

Deposition 

.5 

November 7, 2016 Emails & Phone Call with Kozik & Report to Co-counsel 1.1 



November 8, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel; Receive and Review Synchrony Bank's Answer to 
Plaintiff's Second Amended Class Action Complaint; Draft and Serve 

Document Title: Plaintiff James E. Elias' Requests for Admissions, Set Two, 
to Defendant Synchrony Bank & Plaintiff James E. Elias' Form 

Interrogatories, Set Two, to Defendant Synchrony Bank; Receive and 
ReviewReceive, Review & Calendar Notice from JAMS 

5.2 

November 9, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (3); Email with Administrator .5 

November 10, 2016 Email (2) with JAMS .2 

November 14, 2016 Email Totino; Email (2) with JAMS; Email with Raphael .3 

November 20, 2016 Email from Borison to Totino .1 

November 21, 2016 Email (3) between Borison & Monica Scott; Email from Borison .2 

November 23, 2016 Email (3) with Raphael; Email with JAMS .3 

November 25, 2016 Preparing Discovery Responses; Email (3) Elias 3.5 

November 28, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel & Raphael (4) re call .2 

November 29, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel & Raphael (3) re call; Email from Monica Scott to 
Borison; Call with Opt-in; Email Opt-in; Receive and Review Synchrony 
Bank's Responses to Plaintiff's Special Interrogatories, Set Five; Serve 

Plaintiff's Response to Requests for Production, Set 3 & Plaintiff's Response 
to Special Interrogatories, Set 2 

2.3 

November 30, 2016 Emails (4) with Raphael’s Office; Research Email Defense Counsel re 
Refusal to Substantively Respond to Discovery 

1.5 

December 1, 2016 Email with and conference call with co-counsel and Raphael; Email with 
Defense Counsel (2) 

1.3 

December 2, 2016 Email Raphael; Research and Email with Defense Counsel (2) re Discovery 
Objections; Email JAMS; Email Holland & Borison  

1.8 

December 5, 2016 Email with JAMS; Draft Mediation Statement and Send to Co-counsel; Email 
Elias; Call with and Email Berke; Research and Email (2) Co-counsel 

8.8 

December 6, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel re Amending Answer; Writing Meet & Confer 
Letter on Discovery 

9.3 

December 7, 2016 Write and Send Meet & Confer Letter on Discovery; Conference Call with 
Defense Counsel; Email with Defense Counsel (2); Email with Co-Counsel 

(2) 

6 

December 9, 2016 Research; Email with Co-Counsel (6); Call & Email (2) with Outside Attorney 2.8 

December 12, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (6); Email (3) with Outside Attorney  1 

December 13, 2016 Email with Defense Counsel (2); Email with Co-Counsel including report; Call 
with Borison; Email with Outside Attorney 

1.6 

December 14, 2016 Revise Mediation Statement and send to Rafael; Email (2) with Outside 
Attorney 

4.2 

December 15, 2016 Email Berke; Email Raphael; Email with Co-Counsel  .3 

December 16, 2016 Email Raphael; Call with Raphael; Email with Defense Counsel (3); Email 
Outside Attorney; Email (3) with Borison; Call with Outside Attorney; Call with 

Borison 

3.8 



December 17, 2016 Email (2) with Borison; Call with Borison .4 

December 18, 2016 Email (2) with Borison 1 

December 19, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (19) & research; Call with Borison 6.5 

December 20, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel re research; revising mediation brief 12.1 

December 21, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (10); Email from Defense Counsel re brief & revising 1.8 

December 22, 2016 Email Totino; Email with Co-Counsel (4) re Mediation Statement 3.6 

December 23, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (7) re Mediation; Prepare Spreadsheets & Backup; 
Email Outside Attorney; Email with Defense Counsel (3); Phone Conference 

with Co-counsel 

3.4 

December 24, 2016 Email memo to Borison; Email with Co-Counsel (4) 3.3 

December 26, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (5) with research; Finalize Mediation Brief & Cover 
Letter 

2.5 

December 27, 2016 Email Brief & Cover Letter to Mediator et al.; Email (7) with Holland 1 

December 28, 2016 Email with Co-Counsel (6) & Outside Attorney; Email (4) with JAMS  .9 

January 2, 2017 Check delivery & Email JAMS .1 

January 3, 2017 Research from Borison .3 

January 4, 2017 Email (2) with JAMS; Email (2) with Holland; Email with Defense Counsel (3); 
Receive and Review Defendant’s Discover Responses; Research & Report 

to Co-counsel 

6.6 

January 5, 2017 Email with Co-Counsel (9); Receive and Review Defendant’s Mediation Brief; 
Research & Report to Co-Counsel; Email Outside Attorney 

4.9 

January 8, 2017 Email with Co-Counsel (2) re Mediation logistics .1 

January 9, 2017 Email (2) Elias; Email from JAMS & forward; Research & Email (3) with 
Outside Attorney; Write & Send Discovery Meet & Confer; Email with Co-

Counsel (3)   

6.9 

January 10, 2017 Email with Rafael & Report; Email with Berke .6 

January 11, 2017 Mediation; Meet with Elias before & after; Email to Outside Attorney 13.4 

January 12, 2017 Email from Outside Attorney; Email Co-Counsel .2 

January 13, 2017 Email from Defense Attorney to JAMS; Email from JAMS .2 

January 14, 2017 Email from Borison re JAMS .1 

January 17, 2017 Receive, review & calendar Notice re Court’s Order Granting Stipulation re 
Certification Briefing Schedule; Email (4) with JAMS; Email with Defense 

Counsel 

.8 

January 18, 2017 Email (5) with JAMS; Email with Borison .3 

January 19, 2017 Email (4) with JAMS; Email (2) from Totino; Email with Co-Counsel (3) .6 

January 20, 2017 Email (2) with Totino .3 

January 23, 2017 Email (5) with Totino; Email (4) with & Letter from JAMS & Calendar; Email 
Co-counsel 

.5 

January 24, 2017 Email with Co-Counsel re second mediation session; Email Totino .3 



January 25, 2017 Email with Co-Counsel; Email JAMS .3 

January 26, 2017 Email (3) with Totino; Email with JAMS; Email with Borison .4 

January 27, 2017 Researching and Revising Certification Motion 5.5 

January 30, 2017 Email (2) with JAMS .3 

January 31, 2017 Receive, Review & Calendar Notice of February 7 Conference Call from 
JAMS; Email Co-counsel re conference call 

.3 

February 6, 2017 Email with Defense Counsel (5) & Email with Co-Counsel re call; Call with 
Borison &Defense Counsel 

1.2 

February 7, 2017 Call with Mediator; Email from Co-Counsel re Research; Email Totino; Email 
with Co-Counsel re Call with Mediator 

.4 

February 8, 2017 Emails (2) with JAMS; Email with Borison; Receive and Review draft 
settlement class definition and release from Totino 

.5 

February 9, 2017 Email with Co-Counsel .1 

February 10, 2017 Email(2) with JAMS; Email Borison .2 

February 13, 2017 Email (2) with JAMS; Email (2) with Borison; Email with Berke; Call with Elias .6 

February 14, 2017 Meeting with Borison & Mediation; Email Berke 4.9 

February 17, 2017 Email with Borison (2) .2 

February 20, 2017 Email Totino .2 

February 21, 2017 Email (2) with Totino .2 

February 22, 2017 Call to Clerk; Post Message on CaseAnywhere; Email with Co-Counsel (5) 1 

February 23, 2017 Email (3) with Scott & Peter .3 

February 24, 2017 Call with Scott & Peter; Emails with Berke; Draft and Send Third Amended 
Complaint to Co-Counsel 

2.9 

February 28, 2017 Email with Co-Counsel (5) re Third Amended Complaint; Email Third 
Amended Complaint to Defense Counsel  

.5 

March 1, 2017 Email with Borison re Call with Rafael; Call with Rafael .4 

March 6, 2017 Receive and Review Draft Settlement Agreement & KCC Proposal; Email (3) 
with Scott & Peter re Preliminary Approval Motion 

2.2 

March 7, 2017 Email Totino; Email with Co-Counsel (2) with markup of settlement 
agreement & comments 

1.9 

March 8, 2017 Revising Certification Motion; Emails (4) with Borison re motion 7.1 

March 9, 2017 Receive & Incorporate Borison’s edits to motion; Email (2) with Borison 3.1 

March 13, 2017 Email from Totino re Cy Pres; Email with Co-Counsel (2) re cy pres; Receive 
and Review Defendants’ revisions to settlement agreement & report to co-

counsel 

.3 

March 14, 2017 Email with Peter re Cy Pres; Writing Certification Motion 1.2 

March 15, 2017 Email Elias; Call Elias; Email with Borison & Holland re Cy Pres and 
Settlement Agreement 

.4 



March 16, 2017 Email with Defense Counsel & Emails with Borison (16) re settlement 
agreement 

1.6 

March 17, 2017 Email (16) with Co-counsel re Cert Motion; Email with Defense Counsel (7) 
re Certification Motion; File & Serve Certification Motion 

3.7 

March 20, 2017 Receive and Review Defendant’s Executed Settlement Agreement .1 

April 3, 2017 Call with Berke .2 

April 5, 2017 Email (3) with Borison re Appearing .2 

April 10, 2017 Receive, Review & Calendar Minute Order with Preliminary Approval 
Checklist; Email with Co-Counsel re Minute Order with Preliminary Approval 

Checklist; Call with Co-counsel; File & Serve Third Amended Complaint 

.8 

April 11, 2017 Research & Email with Co-Counsel (2) 2.5 

April 12, 2017 Researching & Writing Further Brief on Preliminary Approval Motion 10.2 

April 15, 2017 Call with Borison; Receive and Review Kozik Fee Agreement .4 

April 16, 2017 Research & Email with Co-Counsel (5) re Retainer Agreements 1.5 

April 17, 2017 Email from CaseAnywhere; Email with Co-Counsel (4); Email with Defense 
Counsel (3) 

.5 

April 18, 2017 Email (5) with Co-counsel & Totino re Call; Email with Co-Counsel (2) re 
Brief; Writing Brief & Declarations 

3.2 

April 19, 2017 Email with Co-Counsel (4) .7 

April 21, 2017 Research & Email with Co-Counsel (3); Email with Defense Counsel (3); Call 
with Totino, et al. 

1.1 

April 24, 2017 Email (5) with Administrator; Email Elias; Email with Co-Counsel (7); Email 
with Defense Counsel (3); Revising Motion; Call with Administrator; Call with 

Clerk 

3.6 

April 27, 2017 Email from Borison to Kozik; Email with Elias; Email with Co-Counsel .5 

April 30, 2017 Email from Holland .1 

May 1, 2017 Email with Defense Counsel (17) re Settlement Agreement; Email with Co-
Counsel (2); Receive and Review & Comment on Settlement Agreement; 

Revising Further Brief on Preliminary Approval 

6.9 

May 2, 2017 Email with Defense Counsel (5) re Settlement Agreement; Finalize, File & 
Serve Further Briefing on Preliminary Approval Motion; Receive and Review 

Defendant’s Message to Court; Message to Court; Receive and Review 
Court’s Response 

2.9 

May 3, 2017 Email with Defense Counsel (3); Email with Co-Counsel (2)  .7 

May 5, 2017 Email with Defense Counsel (6) 1.2 

May 8, 2017 Email with Defense Counsel (3) .2 



May 9, 2017 Email with Defense Counsel (3); Receive and Review Defendant Synchrony 
Bank's Response to the Court's April 10, 2017 Order Directing Further 
Briefing in Support of Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement, 

Declaration of Edward D. Totino in Support of Synchrony Bank's Response to 
the Court's April 10, 2017 Order Directing Further Briefing, [Proposed] Order 
Granting Motion for Preliminary Approval of Class Settlement, and Synchrony 

Bank's Answer to Plaintiffs' Third Amended Class Action Complaint 

.4 

May 10, 2017 Email (3) with Raphael & Holland  .1 

May 17, 2017 Receive, Review & Calendar Notice Re Continuance of Preliminary Approval 
Hearing Continued on Court's Own Motion; Prepare, file & serve Plaintiffs' 
Notice of Continuance of Preliminary Approval Hearing & Proof of Service; 

Phone call with co-counsel  

1.8 

May 20, 2017 Email Elias & Kozik .5 

May 31, 2017 Attend Preliminary Approval Hearing; Report to Co-counsel 3 

June 6, 2017 Email with Defense Counsel (3); Research charities and report; Report & 
Consult with Elias & Kozik 

1.6 

June 8, 2017 Call Clerk; Email with Defense Counsel (5) .8 

June 9, 2017 Email with Defense Counsel (13) .7 

June 10, 2017 Emails (3) with Kozik & Elias .8 

June 11, 2017 Emails (2) with Kozik .2 

June 12, 2017 Emails (2) with Elias; Emails (4) with Totino; Prepare, File & Serve 
Declaration of Jonathan Weiss per May 31 2017 Order re Preliminary 

Approval & [proposed] Order Granting Preliminary Approval 

1.8 

June 20, 2017 Research and Report to Co-counsel; Email with Defense Counsel and 
Administrator (4); Email with Co-Counsel (2) 

.9 

June 21, 2017 Email with Defense Counsel (4); Receive and Review Case Anywhere 
message from Defendant to Court; Email with Administrator; Receive and 
Review Preliminary Approval Order – conformed; Email with Co-Counsel 

.6 

June 22, 2017 Email from Administrator .1 

June 26, 2017 Email (6) with Holland .3 

June 29, 2017 Email (2) with Holland .2 

July 6, 2017 Email from CaseAnywhere (5) .2 

July 12, 2017 Email (2) with Administrator .2 

July 26, 2017 Email (2) with Administrator & Receive and Review .6 

July 28, 2017 Email (2) with Administrator & Receive and Review; Email from Totino to 
Administrator 

.6 

July 31, 2017 Email from Totino to Administrator .1 

August 1, 2017 Email (3) with Administrator  .2 

August 2, 2017 Email (2) with Administrator .2 

August 4, 2017 Email (3) with Administrator .2 

August 7, 2017 Email (2) with Administrator .2 



August 8, 2017 Email (2) with Administrator .2 

August 14, 2017 Voicemail from Elias & Call to Elias .2 

August 16, 2017 Email from Administrator .1 

August 22, 2017 Email (2) with Holland re Pro Hac Vice; Call from Class Member .4 

August 25, 2017 Email from Administrator .1 

September 1, 2017 Email from Administrator .1 

September 5, 2017 Complete form & Email Borison re Pro Hac Vice .3 

September 6, 2017 Email with Co-Counsel (4) re ledger .3 

September 7, 2017 Email with Co-Counsel (2) re motion for approval of attorneys' fees, litigation 
costs, administration costs, and enhancement awards; Email Administrator 

.4 

September 8,  2017 Call with Borison; Receive and Review Email from Administrator; Draft email 
to Administrator; VM to Administrator; Email Administrator; Email (2) from 

Totino to Administrator; Email (2) co-counsel; Call with Administrator 

.5 

September 11, 2017 Emails (2) with, voicemail from, and Call with Administrator; Researching Fee 
Petition; Email Co-counsel re Research 

1.4 

September 12, 2017 Emails to Elias & Kozik; Contact Administrator re online claim forms; email 
and calls with administrator; call with co-counsel re administrator; writing Fee 

Petition 

1.4 

September 13, 2017 Email (2) with administrator; call with co-counsel re administration; writing 
Fee Petition; Email from class member 

1.3 

September 14, 2017 Email to class member .2 

September 22, 2017 Phone call with class member; email administrator .6 

 TOTAL: 922.70 
 
 

 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Exhibit "B" 













 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Exhibit "C" 



Date Matter Description User Rate Total

05/29/2017 14-128 - Elias, James 05. Motions Practice: Work on preparation for
preliminary approval hearing

PETER A. HOLLAND

2.00

$475.00 $950.00

03/18/2017 14-128 - Elias, James 01. Case development, investigation, admin,
communications: emails to/fr co-counsel and
review of cy pres and related issues to filing mtn
for prelim apprval

PETER A. HOLLAND

1.00

$475.00 $475.00

03/15/2017 14-128 - Elias, James 01. Case development, investigation, admin,
communications: Work on Cy Pres issues

PETER A. HOLLAND

1.50

$475.00 $712.50

02/24/2017 14-128 - Elias, James 09. ADR: Work on settlement agreement issues. PETER A. HOLLAND

1.00

$475.00 $475.00

01/11/2017 14-128 - Elias, James 09. ADR: MEDIATION IN ELIAS in Los Angeles PETER A. HOLLAND

8.00

$475.00 $3,800.00

12/27/2016 14-128 - Elias, James 09. ADR: review of final mediation statement and
cover letter to mediator and email
correspondence with co-counsel.

PETER A. HOLLAND

1.00

$475.00 $475.00

12/23/2016 14-128 - Elias, James 09. ADR: two very detailed emails to co-counsel
and detailed phone conf with co-counsel, all re
mediation statement and upcoming mediation

PETER A. HOLLAND

2.50

$475.00 $1,187.50

12/21/2016 14-128 - Elias, James 09. ADR: read, edit, re-edit and several emails
back and forth

PETER A. HOLLAND

6.00

$475.00 $2,850.00

11/30/2016 14-128 - Elias, James 01. Case development, investigation, admin,
communications: Tel call lance rafael

PETER A. HOLLAND

0.50

$475.00 $237.50

09/29/2016 14-128 - Elias, James 01. Case development, investigation, admin,
communications: tel conf w co counsel and Totino
re moving demurrer date and getting an
arbitration

PETER A. HOLLAND

0.50

$475.00 $237.50

08/05/2016 14-128 - Elias, James 05. Motions Practice: Work on Oppos to
Demurrer/Mtn to Strike

PETER A. HOLLAND

1.00

$475.00 $475.00

05/17/2016 14-128 - Elias, James 03. Interrogatories, Document Production, and
Other Written Discovery : review discovery letter
to opposing counsel and send detailed
comments/edits re same to J. Weiss

PETER A. HOLLAND

0.50

$475.00 $237.50

04/07/2016 14-128 - Elias, James Conf call with the Judge PETER A. HOLLAND

1.00

$475.00 $475.00

04/01/2016 14-128 - Elias, James Tel conf re Elias PETER A. HOLLAND

1.00

$475.00 $475.00



Date Matter Description User Rate Total

03/21/2016 14-128 - Elias, James 01. Case development, investigation, admin,
communications: review emails of past several
days re status of case, discovery, Belaire West
Notice, court involvement

PETER A. HOLLAND

0.50

$475.00 $237.50

02/11/2016 14-128 - Elias, James 03. Interrogatories, Document Production, and
Other Written Discovery : tel conf with co-counsel

PETER A. HOLLAND

1.00

$475.00 $475.00

11/19/2015 14-128 - Elias, James 02. Pleadings: tel confs with Jonanthan Weiss
and research re obtaining records from CFPB by
subpoena.

PETER A. HOLLAND

1.00

$475.00 $475.00

03/03/2015 14-128 - Elias, James 02. Pleadings: work over past several days on
Amended Complaint and emails in relation
thereto

PETER A. HOLLAND

3.00

$475.00 $1,425.00

02/27/2015 14-128 - Elias, James 01. Case development, investigation, admin,
communications: Phone Conf w/Jonathan
Weiss,et al

PETER A. HOLLAND

1.00

$475.00 $475.00

02/26/2015 14-128 - Elias, James 01. Case development, investigation, admin,
communications: tel conf and emails with JW

PETER A. HOLLAND

0.00

$475.00 $0.00

01/12/2015 14-128 - Elias, James 01. Case development, investigation, admin,
communications: conf cal with scott et al

PETER A. HOLLAND

1.00

$475.00 $475.00

01/12/2015 14-128 - Elias, James 05. Motions Practice: detailed phone conf w co-
counsel re remand and filing of statement with
court re status

PETER A. HOLLAND

0.80

$475.00 $380.00

11/24/2014 14-128 - Elias, James 05. Motions Practice: review of Response to
Show Cause and draft a brief reply and email
same to co-counsel.

PETER A. HOLLAND

0.50

$475.00 $237.50

10/28/2014 14-128 - Elias, James 01. Case development, investigation, admin,
communications: Tel conf w cocounsel re remand
issues

PETER A. HOLLAND

0.50

$475.00 $237.50

10/28/2014 14-128 - Elias, James 05. Motions Practice: review of motion to remand
and discussion with co-counsel regarding same

PETER A. HOLLAND

0.00

$475.00 $0.00

10/27/2014 14-128 - Elias, James 05. Motions Practice: write introduction to and edit
motion to remand and submit to co-counsel

PETER A. HOLLAND

2.00

$475.00 $950.00

10/03/2014 14-128 - Elias, James 01. Case development, investigation, admin,
communications: Phone Conf - Dial-in Number:
(712) 432-1212 Meeting ID: 239-751-054

PETER A. HOLLAND

1.00

$475.00 $475.00

09/23/2014 14-128 - Elias, James 01. Case development, investigation, admin,
communications: Tel conf w co counsel

PETER A. HOLLAND

1.00

$400.00 $400.00

09/22/2014 14-128 - Elias, James 02. Pleadings: Review complaint and think out
discovery in prep for tel conf

PETER A. HOLLAND

1.50

$400.00 $600.00



Date Matter Description User Rate Total

09/14/2014 14-128 - Elias, James 05. Motions Practice: research pro hac vice rules
and draft Verified Motion for Admission Pro Hac
Vice in Elias case and email same to co-counsel.

PETER A. HOLLAND

0.70

$400.00 $280.00

07/14/2014 14-128 - Elias, James 02. Pleadings: Detailed review and suggested
edits to Complaint

PETER A. HOLLAND

4.00

$400.00 $1,600.00

47.00 $21,785.00
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